
Bid Tabulation RFB 35-09SEP20 

Bid Opening: RFB 35-03SEP20 - Pre-Printed Envelopes 

Bid Tabulation QTY Jayden Graphics American Solutions for Business Cenveo Worldwide Ltd McCauley Printing Co. 

Line Item 4.10.1 150,000 

#10 White Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

Single Sided, informationa l bubble on $21.08/M $ 23.71/M $20.80/M $ 27.73/M 
front, See Paragraph 2.2.1. Extended Total: $3,162.00 htended Total : $3,556.80 Extended Tota l: $3,120.00 Extended Total: $4,159.00 

Line Item 4.10.2 100,000 
#10 Blue Window Envelopes 241b, 

Single Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.2. $ 24.62/M $28.46/M $ 25.25/M $ 41.83/M 
Extended Total : $2,462.00 Extended Total: $2,846.40 Extended Total: $2,525.00 Extended Total: $4,183.00 

Line Item 4.10.3 105,000 
#9 Yellow Insert Envelopes 24 lb. 

$ 21.42/M $24.50/M $33.00/M $ 42.02/M Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.3. 
Extended Total: $2,249.10 Extended Total : $2,572.92 Extended Total : $3,465.00 Extended Total: $4,412.10 

Line Item 4.10.4 45,000 

#9 White Insert envelopes 24 lb, $ 22.02/M $26.26/M $ 27.20/M $ 33.23/M 
Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.4. 

Extended Total: $990.40 Extended Total: $1,181.52 Extended Total: $1,224.00 Extended Total: $1,495.35 

line Item 4.10.5 1,000 
6 ½" x 9 ½" White Envelopes, Single $ 82. 18/M $ 181.16/M $ 174.00/M $228.80/M 
Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.5. Extended Total : $82.18 Extended Total: $181. 16 Extended Total: $174.00 Extended Total: $228.80 

Line Item 4.10.6 

3rd Floor Delivery: Firm, fixed one-

time delivery to 3rd Floor of County 1 $641.73/total $465.00/total No Charge - Included $100.00/total 
Government Center Price. 

Delivery 

21 30 30 30 

Co-Op Yes Yes Yes Yes 
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Bid Tabulation RFB 35 -09SEP20 

Bid Opening: RFB 35-03SEP20 • Pre-Printed Envelopes 

Bid Tabulation QTY Bear Graphics St. Louis Print Group Kansas City En velope Advantage laser General Printing Spot light Printing & Elkins-Swyers Edward J. Rice Co., Inc. 

Products Promotions 

Line Item 4.10.1 150,000 

#10 White Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

Single Sided, Informational bubble on $23.57/M $ 29.22/M $ 21.80/M 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

front, See Paragraph 2.2.1. Extended Total : $3,535.50 Extended Total: $4,383.00 Extended Total : $3,270.00 

line Item 4.10.2 100,000 

#10 Blue Window Envelopes 241b, 

Single Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.2. $26.30/M $ 31.63/M $ 33.36/M 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Extended Total: $2,630.00 Extended Total: $3,163.00 Extended Total: $3,336.00 

Line Item 4.10.3 105,000 

#9 Yel low Insert Envelopes 24 lb. 
$ 23.20/M $ 26.55/M $ 27.22/M 

Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.3. 
Extended Total: $2,436.00 Extended Total: $2,787.75 Extended Total: $2,858.10 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

line Item 4.10.4 45,000 

#9 White Insert envelopes 24 lb, $ 25.57/M $ 26.00/M $ 25.46/M 
Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.4. Extended Tota l : $1,IS0.65 Extended Total: $1,170.00 Extended Total: $1,145.70 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

line Item 4.10.S 1,000 

6 ½" x 9 ½" White Envelopes, Single $ 152.19/M $ 215.58/M $467.81/M 
Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.5. Extended Total: $152.19 Extended Total: $215.58 htended Total : $467.81 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

line Item 4.10.6 

3rd Floor De li very : Firm, fixed one- s /total 
time delivery to 3rd Floor of County 1 $350.00/total $1,900.00/total 

Left Blank 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Government Center Price. 

Delivery 

30 21 30 

Co-Op Yes Yes 

Yes 
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