
45-22AUG19 - RECORDS SHREDDING AND DISPOSAL SERVICES BID TABULATION 

Item II Weight Category Shred-It The Shred Truck Iron Mountain 
(A) Paper Products - Mobile 

Original 
111 Renewal 2nd Renewal 3"' Renewal 4th Renewal 

Original 
t•tRenewal 2•• Renewal 3"' Renewal 4th Renewal 

Original 
111 Renewal 2nd Renewal J

rd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Contract Contract Contract Shredding On-Site 

Period Period Period Period Period 
Period Period Period Period Period 

Period Period Period Period Period 

4.7 0-500 lbs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.1 I 0.1 I 

Over500 lbs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.11 0.11 0.1 l 0.11 0.11 
J>O.UU/ 

minimum 
stop is $30 

32 gallon bin first includes I 4% 4% 4% 4% 
bin or 2 bins $40.00 increase increase increase increase $5.50 

J)~.VV/ 

minimum 
stop is $30 
includes l 4% 4% 4% 4% 

64gallon bin or 2 bins $40.00 increase increase increase increase $11.00 
:t;LL.UU/ 

minimum 
stop is $30 
includes I 4% 4% 4% 4% 

96 gallon bin or 2 bins $40.00 increase increase increase increase $15.00 

(B) Paper Products - Off-Site 
Original 

1st Renewal 2nd Renewal Jrd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

lit Renewal 2nd Renewal 3 rd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

l 1tRenewal 21ld Renewal 3rd Renewal 4th Renewal Contract Contract Contract Shredding 
Period Period Period Period Period 

Period Period Period Period Period 
Period Period Period Period Period 

4.7 0-500 lbs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.11 

Over 500 lbs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.1 I 

Price per 32-Gal 
Consoles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 

Price per 64-Gal 
Bins No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 

Price per 96-Gal 
Bins No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 

(C) Electronic Removable Original 
]

1tRenewal 2nd Renewal 3•• Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

l" Renewal 2nd Renewal 3'•Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

ls1 Renewal 2nd Renewal 3•• Renewal 4th Renewal Media and Hard Drives - Contract Contract Contract 
Mobile Shredding On-Site Period Period Period Period Period 

Period Period Period Period Period 
Period Period Period Period Period 

Price Per Lb. 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a 

Price Per Hard 
Drive or Media 

Source $10.00 $10.00 at time of scheduled services $6.00 



Item# Weight Category Shred-It The Shred Truck Iron Mountain 

No. $100 minimum No Yes. $60.00 (10 minimum) 
(D) Electronic Removable Original 

I st Renewal 2nd Renewal J'' Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

1'1 Renewal 2nd Renewal 3'' Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

I st Renewal 2nd Renewal Jrd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Media and Hard Drives - Contract Contract Contract 

Mobile Shredding Off-Site Period 
Period Period Period Period 

Period 
Period Period Period Period 

Period 
Period Period Period Period 

Price Per Lb. 
1.08 1.08 1.08 1.08 1.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.75 0.99 1.25 1.25 1.49 

Price Per Hard 
Drive or Media 

Source $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 

Base Price Yes. 
Available? No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 

(E) Recycling of Mixed Media 
Original 

1'1 Renewal 2nd Renewal J" Renewal 4th Renewal 
Orizinal 

l 1t Renewal 2nd Renewal 3rd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Original 

1'1 Renewal 2"' Renewal 3rd Renewal 4th Renewal 
Contract Contract Contract 

(Paper Products) Period Period Period Period 
Period 

Period Period Period Period 
Period Period Period Period Period 

Period 

This entire section is charged by bin listed on page 2 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a 
Price per month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4.8 
How is cardboard Do not handle cardboard Do not handle cardboard Do not handle cardboard 
handled? 

4.9 
Address of Disposal Hazelwood, MO Republic Services 2730 W. Main St., Jefferson City, MO 
Location 

4.10 
Backround Checks? Yes, yearly 

InquireHere. 7 year background check per NAID 
Yes. General Information Solutions 

Name of Agency. standards 

4.11 
Bonded & Insured. Yes Yes, we carry Downstream Data Liability Insurance Yes, Covered under a Commercial Crime policy 
Describe. 

4.12 COOP? No No (maybe based on list and service type) Yes 

Alternate bid submitted by The Shred Truck 

Schedules: 

Circuit Clerk 10, 96-gallon bins, 1, 64 gallon bin: 
Service every 4 weeks, $40 first bin, each additional 
bind $10 
Sheriff: 3, 96-gallon bins: Service every 2 weeks, $40 

No Bids 1st bin, each additional bin $10 

OnSite Mobile Joint Communications: 1, 96 gallon bin: Call-in 
Document Destruction service, to be serviced on next County service date, 

of Missouri LLC $40/bin 

Collector: 2, 96 gallon bins: call-in service, to be 
serviced on next County service date, $40/bin 
Clerk: 3, 96 gallon bins: call-in service to be serviced 
on next County service date, $40/bin 

PA: 2, 96 gallon bins, serviced every 2 weeks: $40 1st 
bin, each additional bin $10 



The Shred Truck 
Government Center: 6, 96 gallon binds: service every 
4 weeks: $40 first bin , each additional bin $10 
Children's Services 1, 64 oallon bin . Call-in service, to 

Annual Purn .. ., 
Assessor:: 4, 96 oallon bins, $40/bin 
Leaal: 1, 96 oallon bin, $40/bin 
PA: to purge 50 bins worth of material , will bring bins, 
$40 first bin , each additional bin $10 
Clerk: 3, 96 gallon bins, $40/bin 
Sheriff: 150 boxes, roughly 15 bins, $40/bin 
Collector: 3, 96 gallon bins, $40/bin 
Hard Drive: $10/hard drive 
DVDs/CDs: $0.50/each 
Diskettes: $0.50/each 
Videotapes: $3. 75/each 
Maaentic media (L TO, reel to rell, IBM taoesl:#3.75/e 

Discount available for auantities over 100 on video taoe! 



45-22AUG19 - RECORDS SHREDDING AND DISPOSAL SERVICES BID TABULATION 

ONSITE SHREDDING COMPARISON BY BIN 

Shred It/ Stericycle The Shred Truck Iron Mountain 

Item# Qty 
#times 

Price Total Qty 
#times 

Price Total Qty 
#times 

Price Total per year per year per year 

1st bin: $40; 
Courthouse: 95 gallon (Scheduled) 10 17 $12.00 $2,040.00 10 17 additional $2,210.00 10 17 $15.00 $2,550.00 

bin $10 

Courthouse: 64 gallon (Scheduled) 1 17 $8.00 $136.00 1 17 $40.00 $680.00 1 17 $11.00 $187.00 

1st bin: $40; 
Sheriff 95 gallon (Scheduled) 3 26 $12.00 $936.00 3 26 additional $1,560.00 3 26 $15.00 $1,170.00 

bin $10 

Joint Communications: 95 gallon 
1 12 $12.00 $144.00 1 12 $40.00 $480.00 1 12 $15.00 $180.00 

'Scheduled) 
Collector: 95 aallon (Scheduled) 2 3 $12.00 $72.00 2 3 $40.00 $240.00 2 3 $15.00 $90.00 
Clerk 95 Qallon (Scheduled) 2 3 $12.00 $72.00 2 3 $40.00 $240.00 2 3 $15.00 $90.00 
Children's Services 64 gallon 

1 3 $8.00 $24.00 1 3 $40.00 $120.00 1 3 $11.00 $33.00 
'scheduled) 
Assessor 95 gallon (annual) 4 1 $12.00 $48.00 4 1 $40.00 $160.00 4 1 $15.00 $60.00 
LeQal: 95 aallon (annual) 1 1 $12.00 $12.00 1 1 $40.00 $40.00 1 1 $15.00 $15.00 

1st bin: $40; 
PA: 95 gallon (annual) 50 1 $12.00 $600.00 50 1 additional $530.00 50 1 $15.00 $750.00 

bin $10 

Clerk: 95 aallon (annual) 3 1 $12.00 $36.00 3 1 $40.00 $120.00 3 1 $15.00 $45.00 
Sheriff: 95 aallon (annual) 5 1 $12.00 $60.00 5 1 $40.00 $200.00 5 1 $15.00 $75.00 
Collector: 95 aallon (annual) 3 1 $12.00 $36.00 3 1 $40.00 $120.00 3 1 $15.00 $45.00 

1st bin: $40; 
Gov Center 95 gallon (annual) 6 12 $12.00 $864.00 6 12 additional $1,080.00 6 12 $15.00 $1,080.00 

bin $10 

$5,080.00 $7,780.00 $6,370.00 
Shred-It minimum stop is $30 -

$18.00 
ADD TO LEGAL 
GRAND TOTAL $5,098.00 $7,780.00 $6,370.00 

Shred Truck: $40 1st bin, $10 additional bins on 
Courthouse/Circuit Clerk, Sheriff, PA, Gov Center 


