Bid Tabulation: 44-18JUL19- First Christian Church Parking Lot Mill & Overlay

4.9. PRICING Capital Paving & Construction Frech Paving
Description Unitof | Estimated Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Measure Qty
4.9.1. Asphalt, BP-2, Virgin SY 3600 $ 102518  36,900.00 |$ 1120 |$  40,320.00
Surface Milling, Asphalt,

4.9.2. Contractor Haul-Off SY 3600 $ 350 (8 12,600.00 | $ 51518 18,540.00
4.9.3. Tack Coat LF 3600 $ 0381$ 1,368.00 | $ 0.701 $ 2,520.00
4.9.4. Striping LS 1 $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
4.10. BID TOTAL $ 52,118.00 $  62,580.00

4.11 WEEKEND AND HOLIDAY PRICING

Description Unitof | Estimated Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Measure Qty
4.11.1. Asphalt, BP-2, Virgin SY 3600 $ 1045 ($  37,620.00 NO BID
Surface Milling, Asphalt,

4.11.2. Contractor Haul-Off SY 3600 $ 375($ 13,500.00 NO BID
4.11.3. Tack Coat LF 3600 $ 03818 1,368.00 NO BID
4.11.4. Striping LS 1 $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,250.00 NO BID

4.12 BID TOTAL $  53,738.00 N/A

413 Calendar days for yvork to start from receipt of 120 70

Notice to Proceed
414 Did Bidder provide a list of equipment and labor YES NO

rates?

No Bids




