41-10SEP18 TOWING AND RECOVERY SERVICES TERM AND SUPPLY

BID TABULATION

American Truck G&D Auto Group
Bidder Name: . LLC dba Economy
Repair -
Towing
5.7. Services
5.7.1. Standard Tow Flate Rate Flate Rate
Small Cars/ Light Trucks
(3/4 ton or less) $85.00 $125.00
Medium Duty Trucks (1 ton) $125.00 $225.00
Heavy Duty Trucks/ Heavy $325.00 No Bid

Equipment (greater than 1 ton)

5.7.2. Additional Services Per 15 minutes Per 15 minutes
Flat Tire Repair/Change
(associated with towing) $0.00 $100.00
Flat Tire Repair/Change
(not associated) $0.00 $100.00
Jump Start (associated) $0.00 $100.00
Jump Start (not associated) $0.00 $100.00
Pull Axle/ Drive Shaft (associated) $45.00 $50.00
Small Vehicle Winch Out
(associated) $31.25 $100.00
Small Vehicle Winch Out
(not associated) $55.00 $150.00
Medium Vehicle Winch Out
(associated) $75.00 $100.00
Medium Vehicle Winch Out
(not associated) $95.00 $200.00
Heavy Vehicle Winch Out $125.00 No Bid
(associated) ’
Heavy Vehicle Winch Out $155.00 No Bid
(not associated) '
Extra Man (associated) $35.00 $100.00
573, OutofRange Towingand Per Mile Per Mile
Recovery
Small Vehicle $4.00 $4.00
Medium Vehicle $5.75 $6.00
Heavy Vehicle and Equipment $6.75 No Bid

5.7.4. Recovery of Immobile Vehicles

Per 15 minutes

Per 15 minutes

Small Vehicle $55.00 $125.00
Medium Vehicle $95.00 $225.00
Heavy Vehicle and Equipment $155.00 No Bid
5.7.5. Storage Rates Per Day Per Day
Storage Rate $0.00 $35.00
5.8. Renewals Percentage Percentage
1st Term 5% 10%
2nd Term 6% 10%
3rd Term 7% 10%
4th Term 8% 10%
5.9. Cooperatives Y Y

Bid Opening
September 10, 2018
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