
4.8. Base Bid Pricing

Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total
4.8.1. RSB 3,700 $6.85 $25,345.00 $7.25 $26,825.00 $6.25 $23,125.00 $6.75 $24,975.00
4.8.2. SR1 21,800 $8.25 $179,850.00 $7.65 $166,770.00 $7.25 $158,050.00 $7.50 $163,500.00
4.8.3. SR1.5 19,000 No Bid No Bid $7.65 $145,350.00 $7.25 $137,750.00 $7.50 $142,500.00
4.8.4. SR2.5 300 No Bid No Bid $7.65 $2,295.00 $7.25 $2,175.00 $7.50 $2,250.00
4.8.5. CR1 36,600 $9.95 $364,170.00 $10.20 $373,320.00 $9.75 $356,850.00 $10.10 $369,660.00
4.8.6. CR2 100 $8.75 $875.00 $9.25 $925.00 $8.75 $875.00 $9.15 $915.00
4.8.7. CR3 100 $8.75 $875.00 $9.25 $925.00 $8.75 $875.00 $9.15 $915.00
4.8.8. MS 100 No Bid No Bid $5.75 $575.00 $9.80 $980.00 $9.80 $980.00
4.8.9. QR 500 $6.75 $3,375.00 $8.30 $4,150.00 $7.00 $3,500.00 $7.00 $3,500.00
4.8.10. GQR 100 $12.50 $1,250.00 $11.40 $1,140.00 $10.40 $1,040.00 $10.40 $1,040.00
4.8.11. GQR6X9 200 $10.50 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $9.40 $1,880.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.12. GQR6X12 1,200 $12.50 $15,000.00 $11.30 $13,560.00 $9.60 $11,520.00 $10.50 $12,600.00
4.8.13. WR 100 $4.50 $450.00 $4.30 $430.00 $3.25 $325.00 $3.25 $325.00
4.8.14. GRB 500 No Bid No Bid $7.75 $3,875.00 $7.65 $3,825.00 $7.65 $3,825.00
4.8.15. Pugged Rock 1,000 No Bid No Bid $0.50 $500.00 $0.50 $500.00 $0.50 $500.00
4.8.16. S1.25 T1 6,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $48,000.00
4.8.17. S1.25 T2 4,400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.75 $34,100.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.18. C1.25 2,000 No Bid No Bid $10.10 $20,200.00 $9.60 $19,200.00 $10.00 $20,000.00
4.8.19. Total $593,290.00 $760,840.00 $756,570.00 $795,485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9.

4.9.1. SC.625 3000 $12.35 $37,050.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $30,000.00

4.9.2. C .375 3000 $12.35 $37,050.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $20.85 $62,550.00 $13.50 $40,500.00 No Bid No Bid

4.9.3. C .5 3000 $12.35 $37,050.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $15.00 $45,000.00 $20.85 $62,550.00 $13.50 $40,500.00 No Bid No Bid

4.9.4. Total  No Bid  $  111,150.00  $  135,000.00  $  135,000.00  $  125,100.00  $    81,000.00  $    30,000.00 
4.12.

10% 5% 5% 5% 3% 3% 3%
10% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5%

593,290.00$      871,990.00$      891,570.00$      930,485.00$      125,100.00$      81,000.00$        30,000.00$        

Capital Sand Company   
(Pick - Up)

GRAND TOTAL

Boone Quarries - 
Millersburg Boone Quarries - Riggs Captial Sand Company, Inc. 

(Delivered)

Renewal Pricing Increases

BID TABULATION

Capital Quarries Company 
Inc.

RFB #: 23-30APR18 - Crushed Stone 
Aggregate and Chip Seal Products

Chip Seal Pricing:

Boone Quarries - East/West

1st Renewal Term
2nd Renewal Term

Central Stone Company - 
CS58



23-30APR18 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products

4.10. Delivery Pricing - Crushed Stone Aggregate (Not Chip Seal)
Schedule A B C D E F G H I

Fuel Price <$1.75 $1.75 - <2.00 $2.00 - <2.25 $2.25 - <2.50 $2.50 - <2.75 $2.75 - <3.00 $3.00 – <3.25 $3.25 – <3.50 $3.50 – <3.75
Distance (Miles) $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton $ / Ton

4.10.1. 0 - <5 2.50$             2.75$             3.00$             3.25$             3.50$             3.75$             4.00$             4.25$             4.50$             
4.10.2. 5 - <10 3.25$             3.75$             4.00$             4.25$             4.50$             4.75$             5.00$             5.25$             5.50$             
4.10.3. 10 - <15 3.80$             4.05$             4.30$             4.55$             4.80$             5.05$             5.30$             5.55$             5.80$             
4.10.4. 15 - <20 4.35$             4.60$             4.85$             5.10$             5.35$             5.60$             5.85$             6.10$             6.35$             
4.10.5. 20 - <25 5.10$             5.35$             4.60$             5.85$             6.10$             6.35$             6.60$             6.85$             7.10$             
4.10.6. 25 - <30 6.85$             6.10$             6.35$             6.60$             6.85$             7.10$             7.35$             7.60$             7.85$             
4.10.7. 30 - <35 6.60$             6.85$             7.10$             7.35$             7.60$             7.85$             8.10$             8.35$             8.60$             
4.10.8. 35 - <40 7.35$             7.60$             7.85$             8.10$             8.35$             8.60$             8.85$             9.10$             9.35$             

Total 39.80$           41.05$           42.05$           45.05$           47.05$           49.05$           51.05$           53.05$           55.05$           
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases

1st Renewal Term 10% 423.20$         
2nd Renewal Term 10%

4.10.1. 0 - <5 2.85$             2.85$             2.85$             2.85$             2.85$             2.85$             2.95$             3.05$             3.20$             
4.10.2. 5 - <10 3.60$             3.60$             3.60$             3.60$             3.60$             3.60$             3.65$             3.80$             4.00$             
4.10.3. 10 - <15 4.15$             4.15$             4.15$             4.15$             4.15$             4.15$             4.35$             4.50$             4.60$             
4.10.4. 15 - <20 5.05$             5.05$             5.05$             5.05$             5.05$             5.05$             5.20$             5.35$             5.50$             
4.10.5. 20 - <25 5.85$             5.85$             5.85$             5.85$             5.85$             5.85$             5.95$             6.10$             6.20$             
4.10.6. 25 - <30 6.35$             6.35$             6.35$             6.35$             6.35$             6.35$             6.50$             6.60$             6.75$             
4.10.7. 30 - <35 7.05$             7.05$             7.05$             7.05$             7.05$             7.05$             7.15$             7.30$             7.40$             
4.10.8. 35 - <40 8.00$             8.00$             8.00$             8.00$             8.00$             8.00$             8.00$             8.10$             8.25$             

Total 42.90$           42.90$           42.90$           42.90$           42.90$           42.90$           43.75$           44.80$           45.90$           
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases

1st Renewal Term 5% 391.85$         
2nd Renewal Term 5%

4.10.1. 0 - <5 2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.85$             2.95$             3.05$             3.20$             
4.10.2. 5 - <10 3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.50$             3.65$             3.80$             4.00$             
4.10.3. 10 - <15 4.05$             4.05$             4.05$             4.05$             4.05$             4.20$             4.35$             4.50$             4.60$             
4.10.4. 15 - <20 4.80$             4.80$             4.80$             4.80$             4.80$             5.10$             5.20$             5.35$             5.50$             
4.10.5. 20 - <25 5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.80$             5.95$             6.10$             6.20$             
4.10.6. 25 - <30 6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.35$             6.50$             6.60$             6.75$             
4.10.7. 30 - <35 6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             7.00$             7.15$             7.30$             7.40$             
4.10.8. 35 - <40 7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.85$             8.00$             8.10$             8.25$             

Total 41.05$           41.05$           41.05$           41.05$           41.05$           42.65$           43.75$           44.80$           45.90$           
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases

1st Renewal Term 5% 382.35$         
2nd Renewal Term 5%

4.10.1. 0 - <5 2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.70$             2.85$             2.95$             3.05$             3.20$             
4.10.2. 5 - <10 3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.40$             3.50$             3.65$             3.80$             4.00$             
4.10.3. 10 - <15 4.00$             4.00$             4.00$             4.00$             4.00$             4.20$             4.35$             4.50$             4.60$             
4.10.4. 15 - <20 4.90$             4.90$             4.90$             4.90$             4.90$             5.10$             5.20$             5.35$             5.50$             
4.10.5. 20 - <25 5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.60$             5.80$             5.95$             6.10$             6.20$             
4.10.6. 25 - <30 6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.10$             6.35$             6.50$             6.60$             6.75$             
4.10.7. 30 - <35 6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             6.75$             7.00$             7.15$             7.30$             7.40$             
4.10.8. 35 - <40 7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.65$             7.85$             8.00$             8.10$             8.25$             

Total 41.10$           41.10$           41.10$           41.10$           41.10$           42.65$           43.75$           44.80$           45.90$           
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases

1st Renewal Term 5% 382.60$         
2nd Renewal Term 5%

4.10.1. 0 - <5 2.69$             2.75$             2.81$             2.88$             2.94$             3.08$             3.21$             3.35$             3.53$             
4.10.2. 5 - <10 3.41$             3.54$             3.60$             3.66$             3.73$             3.84$             3.99$             4.16$             4.38$             
4.10.3. 10 - <15 4.00$             4.06$             4.13$             4.19$             4.25$             4.40$             4.59$             4.76$             4.90$             
4.10.4. 15 - <20 4.78$             4.84$             4.90$             4.96$             5.03$             5.21$             5.36$             5.54$             5.71$             
4.10.5. 20 - <25 5.54$             5.60$             5.41$             5.73$             5.79$             5.95$             6.11$             6.29$             6.43$             
4.10.6. 25 - <30 6.35$             6.16$             6.23$             6.29$             6.35$             6.54$             6.71$             6.85$             7.03$             
4.10.7. 30 - <35 6.79$             6.85$             6.91$             6.98$             7.04$             7.23$             7.39$             7.56$             7.70$             
4.10.8. 35 - <40 7.66$             7.73$             7.79$             7.85$             7.91$             8.08$             8.21$             8.35$             8.53$             

Total 41.21$           41.53$           41.78$           42.53$           43.03$           44.31$           45.58$           46.86$           48.19$           
4.12. Renewal Pricing Increases

395.00$         

GRAND TOTAL

BID TABULATION
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