
RFB 52-13NOV14  INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING

Item # Description Estimated Qty Unit Price
Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

4.7.1.
Mattresses-Section 
2.5.1. 100 each No Bid No Bid

4.7.2.
Wool Blankets-
Section 2.5.2. 300 each No Bid $7.35/each $2,205.00

4.7.3.
Poly Cotton Blankets-
Section 2.5.3. 100 each

$13.25/ea; A-2810 (66" x 
93" $1,325.00 $9.04/each $904.00

4.7.4.
Slip on PVC sandals- 
Section 2.5.4.1. 200 pair No Bid $1.14/pair $228.00

4.7.5.
 Slip on PVC sandals- 
Section 2.5.4.2. 20 pair No Bid $3.40/pair $68.00

4.7.6.
Sandals, black-
Section 2.5.4.3. 20 pair No Bid $1.42/pair $28.40

4.7.7.
Toothpaste-Section 
2.5.5. 35 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.8.
Toothbrushes-
Section 2.5.6.1. 35 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.9.
Toothbrushes-
Section 2.5.6.2. 5 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.10. Soap-Section 2.5.7.1. 4 cases
$19.80/cs; F-502; 
200/case $79.20 No Bid

4.7.11. Soap-Section 2.5.7.2. 75 cases No Bid No Bid

No Bids: Alamar Uniforms
Central Poly Corporation
Smith Paper

Comade, Inc.Missouri Vocational Enterprises



RFB 52-13NOV14  INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING

Item # Description
Estimated 
Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

4.7.12. Razors-Sec 2.5.8. 50 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.13. Shampoo-Sec 2.5.9. 100 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.14. Combs-Sec 2.5.10. 25 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.15. ID Bands-Sec 2.5.11. 75 cases No Bid No Bid
4.7.15.1. Fastening Tool 1 ea No Bid No Bid

4.7.16.
Cleaning Detergent-
Sec 2.5.12. 60 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.17.
White Bath Towels-
Sec 2.5.13. 10 bales

$570.00/bale; 300 
per bale or 25 dz; A-
2003; (20" x 40") 
$1.90/ea; sold in 
boxes $5,700.00 $399.00/bale $3,999.00

4.7.18.
Brown Bath Towels-
Sec 2.5.13. 5 dozen No Bid $15.61/dozen $78.05

4.7.19.
Wash Cloths, Brown-
Sec 2.5.13. 20 dozen $7.80/dozen $156.00 $5.83/dozen $29.15

4.7.20.

Latex gloves-Sec 
2.5.14. Submit 
Sample 100 boxes No Bid No Bid

4.7.21.
Sanitary Napkins-Sec 
2.5.15. 25 cases No Bid No Bid

Missouri Vocational Enterprises Comade, Inc.
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4.7.22. Tampons-Sec 2.5.16. 25 cases No Bid No Bid

4.7.23.
Women's Underwear-Sec 
2.5.17. 25 dozen

Size 5-8: $2.20/ea: $26.40/dz; Sz 9-
12: $2.40/ea: $28.80/dz; Sz 13-15: 
$2.55/ea: $30.60/dz; Sz 16-18: 
$2.75/ea: $33.00/dz; Sz 19-20: 
$3.00/ea: $36.00/dz; A-1807 * Varies by size $18.95/dozen $473.25

4.7.24. Shirts-Sec 2.5.18. 20 each No Bid $7.15/each $143.00
4.7.25. Sweatpants-Sec 2.5.19. 20 each $14.55/each; A-1305 adult $291.00 $19.91/each $398.20
4.7.26. Shoes-Sec 2.5.20. 20 pair No Bid $8.88/pair $177.60
4.7.27. Pen-Sec 2.5.21. 15000 ea No Bid No Bid

4.8.
Minimum discount for all 
product lines not specified:

4.9. Delivery turnaround

4.10.
Maximum % Increase on 
renewals 1st Renewal

2nd Renewal
3rd Renewal
4th Renewal

4.11. Cooperative Purchasing
* Ladies cotton brief: in Navy,
White, Green, and Grey

Missouri Vocational Enterprises Comade, Inc.
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