
RFB 52-13NOV14  INMATE DETENTION SUPPLIES- TERM & SUPPLY

PRICING

Item # Description Estimated Qty Unit Price
Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended Price

4.7.1.
Mattresses-Section 
2.5.1. 100 each $27.86/ea; #PJM25754 $2,786.00 No Bid

4.7.2.
Wool Blankets-
Section 2.5.2. 300 each $6.14/ea; #WSB6690 $1,842.00 No Bid

4.7.3.
Poly Cotton Blankets-
Section 2.5.3. 100 each

$6.34/ea; $95.10/cs of 15; 
#CZ6690GY $634.00 No Bid

4.7.4.
Slip on PVC sandals- 
Section 2.5.4.1. 200 pair $1.52/pair; #80302 $30.40 No Bid

4.7.5.
 Slip on PVC sandals- 
Section 2.5.4.2. 20 pair $2.59/pair; #606 $51.80 No Bid

4.7.6.
Sandals, black-
Section 2.5.4.3. 20 pair $2.97/pair; #SEVA-BK $59.40 No Bid

4.7.7.
Toothpaste-Section 
2.5.5. 35 cases $34.11/cs; 144/cs; #MST15 $1,193.85

$28.80/cs; 144/cs; 
#TP-15 $1,008.00

4.7.8.
Toothbrushes-
Section 2.5.6.1. 35 cases $5.31/cs; 144/cs; #BB28 $185.85

$59.00/cs; 1440/cs; 
#TB-30 $2,065.00

4.7.9.
Toothbrushes-
Section 2.5.6.2. 5 cases $4.97/cs; 144/cs; #BBST25 $24.85

$115.20/cs; 1440/cs; 
#TB-SH-F $576.00

4.7.10. Soap-Section 2.5.7.1. 4 cases $76.15/cs; 500/cs; #TU15 $304.60
$65.00/cs; 500/cs; 
#S-15-UN $260.00

4.7.11. Soap-Section 2.5.7.2. 75 cases $37.92/cs; 1000/cs; #U1 $2,844.00
$39.95/cs; 2000/cs; 
#S-1/2-UN $2,996.25

No Bids: Alamar Uniforms
Central Poly Corporation
Smith Paper

Amercare Products, Inc.Bob Barker Company, Inc.
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4.7.12. Razors-Sec 2.5.8. 50 cases $46.46/cs; 1000/cs; #CLR1000 $2,323.00
$27.50/cs; 500/cs; #RA2-
1-500 $1,375.00

4.7.13.
Shampoo-Sec 
2.5.9. 100 cases $21.86/cs; 96/cs; #MS2 $2,186.00 $28.80/cs; 96/cs; #SH-2 $2,880.00

4.7.14. Combs-Sec 2.5.10. 25 cases $3.38/cs; 144/cs; #C-5 $84.50 $43.20/cs; 2160/cs; #C-5 $1,080.00

4.7.15.
ID Bands-Sec 
2.5.11. 75 cases $124.90/cs; 500/cs; #646-OR $9,367.50 No Bid

4.7.15.1. Fastening Tool 1 ea $85.95/each; #647 $85.95 No Bid

4.7.16.

Cleaning 
Detergent-Sec 
2.5.12. 60 cases $43.25/cs; 180/cs; #90650 $2,595.00 No Bid

4.7.17.
White Bath 
Towels-Sec 2.5.13. 10 bales

$15.44/bale; 1 dz per bale; 
#41400 $154.40 No Bid

4.7.18.
Brown Bath 
Towels-Sec 2.5.13. 5 dozen $18.05/dz; #BT2040BR $90.25 No Bid

4.7.19.
Wash Cloths, 
Brown-Sec 2.5.13. 20 dozen $3.01/dz; #WC1212BR $60.20 No Bid

4.7.20.

Latex gloves-Sec 
2.5.14. Submit 
Sample 100 boxes $10.19/bx; 50/bx; #4436 $1,019.00 No Bid

4.7.21.
Sanitary Napkins-
Sec 2.5.15. 25 cases $29.00/cs; 250/cs; #SN-C $725.00

$16.25/cs; 250/cs; #AF-
250 $406.25

Bob Barker Company, Inc. Amercare Products, Inc.
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4.7.22. Tampons-Sec 2.5.16. 25 cases $45.04/cs; 500/cs; #TPX500 $1,126.00
$48.50/cs; 500/cs; #AMT-
500 $1,212.50

4.7.23.
Women's Underwear-
Sec 2.5.17. 25 dozen $8.22/dz; #ELBLS  Sizes 5-16 $205.50 No Bid

4.7.24. Shirts-Sec 2.5.18. 20 each $2.97/ea; #ZCTSMA $59.40 No Bid

4.7.25. Sweatpants-Sec 2.5.19. 20 each $6.08/ea; #SPGY $121.60 No Bid
4.7.26. Shoes-Sec 2.5.20. 20 pair $6.10/pr; #B854 $122.00 No Bid

4.7.27. Pen-Sec 2.5.21. 15000 ea
$0.12/ea; $17.28/cs; 144/cs; 
#MSBP $1,797.12 $0.18/each; #PEN-SEC $2,700.00

4.8.

Minimum discount for 
all product lines not 
specified:

4.9. Delivery turnaround

4.10.
Maximum % Increase 
on renewals 1st Renewal

2nd Renewal
3rd Renewal
4th Renewal

4.11. Cooperative Purchasing

5%
7%
Yes

5%
7 DAYS

3%
4%
5%
6%
Yes

3%
3-30 DAYS

0%
0%

Bob Barker Company, Inc. Amercare Products, Inc.
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