
21-07MAY14 - Road Construction Equipment 
Rental Term and Supply 1-Primary 2-Secondary 3-Tertiary 4-Quaternary 5-Quinary 6-Senary  

BID TABULATION
4.7. PRICING

Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery 
Date ARO 
Number of 

Days 
Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery 
Date ARO 
Number of 

Days 
Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery Date 
ARO 

Number of 
Days 

4.7.1.
Self-propelled Single-Smooth Drum Vibratory 
Roller Volvo / SD 100 +20% of cost $3,850.00 5

Bomag / 
BW213DH-40 $6,850.00 10 Cat/CS56 B/2013 0 $5,940.00 10

4.7.2.
Self-propelled Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory 
Roller

Volvo / SD 100 
w/Padfoot +20% of cost $4,325.00 5

Bomag / 
BW214PDH-40 $6,850.00 10 Cat/CP56 B/2013 0 $6,250.00 10

4.7.3. Self-propelled Pneumatic Tire Compactor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bomag / 

BW11RH $4,100.00 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7.4. Crawler Dozer JD / 850 +20% of cost $8,500.00 5
John Deere / 

850K $7,150.00 10 Cat/D6T/2013 0 $9,240.00 10

4.7.5. Finish Dozer JD / 650 JLGP +20% of cost $3,870.00 5
John Deere / 

650K $4,300.00 10 Cat/D5K-2/2013 0 $4,840.00 10

4.7.6. Track Excavator JD / 200 +20% of cost $4,695.00 5
John Deere / 

210G $5,850.00 10 Cat/320E/2013 0 $6,760.00 10

4.7.6.1. Hydraulic Quick Coupler
Cat/Dual 
lock/2013 0

Included 
w/320E 10

4.7.6.2. Hydraulic Breaker Kent 11 / KH B30 +20% of cost $3,295.00 5 NPK / GH9 $6,000.00 10 Cat/H120/2013 0 $5,860.00 10

4.7.6.3. 36” Severe Duty Bucket +20% of cost $175.00 5
Cat/B320-
36"/2013 0 $200.00 10

4.7.6.4. 60” Ditching Bucket +20% of cost $195.00 5
72" - Cat/B320-

72" 0 $200.00 10

4.7.7. Backhoe 4WD JD Ext / 310 +20% of cost $1,850.00 5
John Deere / 

310SK $2,500.00 10 Cat/420E/2013 0 $2,800.00 10

4.7.8. Self-propelled Water Tanker Distributor
Ledwell / 3700 
Gallon +20% of cost $3,495.00 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Freightliner/M2-
4000 gal/2006 0 $5,500.00 10

4.7.9. Compact Track Loader JD / 329 +20% of cost $1,695.00 5
John Deere / 

333E $3,300.00 10 Cat/299D/2013 0 $2,740.00 5

4.7.10. Mini Excavator John Deere / 50D +20% of cost $1,695.00 5 John Deere / 50G $3,000.00 10 Cat 305.5E/2013 0 $2,740.00 5

4.7.11. Small Tandem Vibratory Roller Wacker / RD 12 +20% of cost $1,350.00 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cat/CB24/2012 0 $1,560.00 10

4.7.12. Message Board 0 (Solartek MB4048 OR EQUAL) Allmond / 2200 SE +20% of cost $1,050.00 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7.13. Arrow Board - (Solarktek AB0525D or EQUAL)
ADDCO / DH 
10000 +20% of cost $425.00 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation Tri-State Construction Equipment Co.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Doesn't meet specifications

Fabick Cat

EQUIPMENT

Included with Item 4.7.6.



21-07MAY14 - Road Construction Equipment 
Rental Term and Supply 1-Primary 2-Secondary 3-Tertiary 4-Quaternary 5-Quinary 6-Senary  

BID TABULATION
      

Doesn't meet specifications

 4.8. FIELD SERVICE
4.8.1. Hourly Labor Charge $126.00
4.8.2. Trip Setup or Trip Fee $0.00
4.8.3. Mileage Fee Per Mile $4.50

Maximum % Increase 1st Renewal Period 0%
Maximum % Increase 2nd Renewal Period 5%
Maximum % Increase 3rd Renewal Period 10%

Y
0%
Y

5%
Y

$1.50$0.00

$137.00
No Charge

0%
0%

5%
5%

$115.00

Coop ?



21-07MAY14 - Road Construction Equipment 
Rental Term and Supply

BID TABULATION
4.7. PRICING

4.7.1.
Self-propelled Single-Smooth Drum Vibratory 
Roller

4.7.2.
Self-propelled Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory 
Roller

4.7.3. Self-propelled Pneumatic Tire Compactor

4.7.4. Crawler Dozer

4.7.5. Finish Dozer

4.7.6. Track Excavator

4.7.6.1. Hydraulic Quick Coupler

4.7.6.2. Hydraulic Breaker

4.7.6.3. 36” Severe Duty Bucket

4.7.6.4. 60” Ditching Bucket

4.7.7. Backhoe 4WD

4.7.8. Self-propelled Water Tanker Distributor

4.7.9. Compact Track Loader

4.7.10. Mini Excavator

4.7.11. Small Tandem Vibratory Roller

4.7.12. Message Board 0 (Solartek MB4048 OR EQUAL)

4.7.13. Arrow Board - (Solarktek AB0525D or EQUAL)

EQUIPMENT
Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery 
Date ARO 
Number of 

Days 
Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery 
Date ARO 
Number of 

Days 
Make/Model/ 
Year/Meter

Parts:  Cost 
Plus % 
Amount

Monthly 
Lease Cost 

Delivery 
Date ARO 
Number of 

Days 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volvo/SD115D/ 

2013 30% $5,990.00 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volvo/SD115F/ 

2014 30% $5,990.00 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volvo/PT125R/ 

2011 30% $4,640.00 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Doosan/DX225/ 
2013 or newer MSRP $4,000.00

Same Day to 
48 hrs

Volvo/EC220/ 
2013 30% $6,740.00 3 Volvo/EC140 30% $4,620.00 15-30

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Stanley/MBX 
308/2013 or 

newer MSRP $4,000.00
Same Day to 

48 hrs
Allied/3500-4000 

ft. lbs. / 2012 30%

$4,800.00 plus 
$700.00 Deliv. 

if not on 
Excav. 3 Kent/KF9/ 2014 30% $2,750.00 15-30

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volvo/BL70B/ 

2013 30% $3,740.00 3
Volvo/BL60/ 

2014 30% $1,815.00 15-30

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ledwell/4000/ 

2011 30% $6,390.00 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Takeuchi/Bobcat/
7210/T750/T770/

2013 or newer MSRP $2,850.00
Same Day to 

48 hrs
Volvo/MCT135/ 

2012/317 30% $4,010.00 3
Volvo/MCT125/ 

2014 30% $2,530.00 15-30
Takeuchi/Bobcat/
TB250/E50/2013 

or newer MSRP $1,750.00
Same Day to 

48 hrs
Volvo/ECR58/ 

2013/192 30% $4,055.00 3
Hitachi/ZX35/ 

2014 30% $1,870.00 15-30

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rudd Equipment Company

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Bobcat of St. Louis ($150 trip fee from Item 4.8.2. added to 
rental prices for tabulation)

Included with Item 4.7.6.

Included with Item 4.7.6.

G.W. Van Keppel Co. ($490 trip fee from Item 4.8.2. added 
to rental prices for tabulation)



21-07MAY14 - Road Construction Equipment 
Rental Term and Supply

BID TABULATION
4.8. FIELD SERVICE

4.8.1. Hourly Labor Charge
4.8.2. Trip Setup or Trip Fee
4.8.3. Mileage Fee Per Mile

Maximum % Increase 1st Renewal Period
Maximum % Increase 2nd Renewal Period
Maximum % Increase 3rd Renewal Period
Coop ?

              
   

           
    

5%
5%

$115.00 / $135.00 After Hours

$2.50

$136.00
$490.00 $0.00

$2.75
$150.00

N/A
3%

5%
Y

$99.99

0%
0%
0%
Y

3%
3%
Y
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