10-27FEB13 - Law Enforcement Uniforms

BID TABULATION ALAMAR UNIFORM RED THE UNIFORM TAILOR
Iltem Unit Price Qty | Extended Price Unit Price Qty | Extended Price
4.14.|PRICING - Any substitution item submitted must meet or exceed the minimum specifications.

4.14.1.

Long Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus, Material content to be 65% dacron polyester and 35% rayon, 10 ounce
one ply tropical weave. Must furnish shirts in full and half sizes (e.g. 17 and 17 %).

Comparable Substitution:

Oversizes start at 18 1/2; 80%

Elbeco 582 Mens; 9582L.C Womens polyester/20% rayon
Men's Sizes $44.79 60 $2,687.40 $45.50 60 $2,730.00
Women's Sizes $44.79 10 $447.90 $45.50 10 $455.00
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 $54.60 $0.00

4.14.2.

Short Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus, Material content to be 65% dacron polyester and 35% rayon, 10 ounce
one ply tropical weave. Must furnish shirts in full and half sizes (e.g. 17 and 17 %).

Comparable Substitution:

Elbeco 5582 mens; 9782 LC womens

Oversizes start at 18 1/2; 80%
polyester/20% rayon

Men's Sizes $40.76 60 $2,445.60 $41.40 60 $2,484.00
Women's Sizes $40.76 10 $407.60 $41.40 10 $414.00
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 $51.75 $0.00
4.14.3. Clip on Ties
Regular Size $4.00 10 $40.00 $5.75 10 $57.50
Extra Long $4.25 5 $21.25 $5.75 5 $28.75
Brand/Model Samuel Broome 90001
4.14.4,

Baselayer Short Sleev

e Crew Neck Under Shirt (Comparable to Under Armour "Heat Gear" Fitted style)

Color MUST match color of Turtlenect Shirt submitted on item 4.14.5.
Comparable Substitution: | UnderArmour TAC TechT Army Brown;
100% Polyester
Men's Sizes $17.68 100 $1,768.00 NO BID 100
Women's Sizes $17.68 10 $176.80 NO BID 10
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00
4.14.5|Regulation Elbeco ELB 8601 Turtleneck Shirt: Pre-shrunk 100% totton jersey knit.
Comparable Substitution:
Elbeco Discontinued. Item: Blauer 8110X. Cotton &
lycra. Elbeco has 1,000 pieces all sizes $17.50.
Once gone, no addition of stock to be manufactured
Unisex $21.50 100 $2,150.00 NO BID 100
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

4.14.6.

Blauer 8560 / 8560W T

rousers: 75/25 wool blend with 10% stretc

h; 2 hip pockets

Comparable Substitution:

Blauer 8560; 8560W

RTUT Custom, no silicone creases.
Ratford 6038. 75/25 polyester/NOV

Men's Sizes $75.93 60 $4,555.80 $72.35 60 $4,341.00
Women's Sizes $75.93 10 $759.30 $72.35 10 $723.50
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4.14.7.

Spiewak Style #S1780 WatherTech Tactical Response Parka




10-27FEB13 - Law Enforcement Uniforms

BID TABULATION ALAMAR UNIFORM RED THE UNIFORM TAILOR
Iltem Unit Price Qty | Extended Price Unit Price Qty | Extended Price
Unisex $183.76 5 $918.80 NO BID 5
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
4.14.8.|Spiewak Style #S3616 WeatherTech Systems Duty Jacket **NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED**
Unisex $99.96 10 $999.60 NO BID 10
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
4.14.9
Spiewak Style #S327 Public Safety Performance Fleece/Liner *NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALL OWED**
Unisex $83.80 15 $1,257.00 NO BID 15
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
4.14.10. :
5.11 4-in-1 Patrol Jacket Style #48027
Unisex $207.75 10 $2,077.50 NO BID 10
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 NO BID $0.00
Brand/Model | Spiewak SH3466 w/ 5319 Jacket Liner
4.14.11 Istratton Winter Felt Uniform Hat
Comparable Substitution:
Unisex $110.00 | 5 | $550.00 $108.60 | 5 | $543.00
4.14.12.{Stratton Summer Straw Uniform Hat
Comparable Substitution:
Unisex $73.57 | 5 | $367.85 $73.95 | 5 | $369.75
4.14.13.| Reversible Raincoat - Blauer 26990 Rain Jacket
Comparable Substitution: Blauer 26990
Unisex $104.00 10 $1,040.00 NO BID 10
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Optional Hood $9.45 $0.00 NO BID
4.14.14. Elbeco E615RN Tek 2 Cargo Trousers - no substitutions
Men's Sizes $61.20 100 $6,120.00 $54.75 100 $5,475.00
Women's Sizes $61.20 10 $612.00 $54.75 10 $547.50
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 $60.88 $0.00
4.14.15. Trouser: Blauer 8810X - Side Pocket Cotton Blend Trousers - no substitutions
Men's Sizes $58.05 50 $2,902.50 NO BID 100
Women's Sizes $58.05 5 $290.25 NO BID 10
Standard Oversize Charge
Cost Per Incremental Size
Over XXL $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
4.14.16. Minimum discount for all product lines introduced
after inception of the contract, and all existing lines
not specified herein 15% 10%

Totals:

Maximum % Increase for 1st Renewal

4%

4%




10-27FEB13 - Law Enforcement Uniforms

BID TABULATION ALAMAR UNIFORM RED THE UNIFORM TAILOR
Iltem Unit Price Qty | Extended Price Unit Price Qty | Extended Price
Maximum % Increase for 2nd Renewal 4% 4%
COOP? NO NO
Delivery ARO 10-14 DAYS 30-75 DAYS
No Bids

Joy Corporation, Inc.

Received One Late Bid - returned to sender

Southern Uniform & Equipment
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