08-14FEB13 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products Term and Supply

BID TABULATION ConAgg of MO, LLC d/b/a Boone Quarries Mid-Missouri Limeston, Riggs Quarry Mid-Missouri Limeston, Millersburg Quarry
4.7 BASE BID PRICING - Crushed Stone Aggregated - For the Furnishing and Delivery FOB Destination and FOB Plant
DESCRIPTION | Unit of Measure Tons UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
APPROXIMATE QTY PER TON EXTENDED PRICE PER TON EXTENDED PRICE PER TON EXTENDED PRICE
4.7.1. RSB 50,000 $6.28 $314,000.00 6.00 $300,000.00 5.75 $287,500.00
4.7.2. SR1 75,000 $6.69 $501,750.00 6.95 $521,250.00 6.70 $502,500.00
4.7.3. SR1.5 50,000 $6.69 $334,500.00 6.95 $347,500.00 6.70 $335,000.00
4.74. SR2.5 25,000 $6.40 $160,000.00 6.95 $173,750.00 6.70 $167,500.00
4.7.5. CR1 50,000 $9.00 $450,000.00 9.25 $462,500.00 9.00 $450,000.00
4.7.6. CRIL.5 1,000 $8.90 $8,900.00 8.50 $8,500.00 8.40 $8,400.00
4.7.7. CR2 500 $7.96 $3,980.00 8.50 $4,250.00 8.40 $4,200.00
4.7.8. CR3 1,500 $7.96 $11,940.00 8.50 $12,750.00 8.40 $12,600.00
4.7.9. MS 3,500 $5.00 $17,500.00 9.00 $31,500.00 9.00 $31,500.00
4.7.10.] QR 1,500 $7.39 $11,085.00 6.45 $9,675.00 6.45 $9,675.00
4.7.11.] GQR 500 $10.11 $5,055.00 9.25 $4,625.00 8.85 $4,425.00
4.7.12.] SP 500 $10.11 $5,055.00 8.75 $4,375.00 8.50 $4,250.00
4.7.13.] WR 2,000 $3.91 $7,820.00 3.25 $6,500.00 3.00 $6,000.00
4.7.14.] GQR6X9 1,500 $10.11 $15,165.00 9.25 $13,875.00 9.00 $13,500.00
4.7.15.] GQR6X12 1,000 $10.11 $10,110.00 9.25 $9,250.00 9.00 $9,000.00
4.7.16.] SC.375 1,500 $10.87 $16,305.00 15.00 $22,500.00 no bid $0.00
4.7.17.] SC.5 6,000 $10.87 $65,220.00 13.00 $78,000.00 no bid $0.00
4.7.18.] SP=Spalls 1000 $10.11 $10,110.00 8.75 $8,750.00 8.50 $8,500.00
4.7.19.]  Fill Material 1000 $5.25 $5,250.00 3.00 $3,000.00 3.00 $3,000.00
Pugged Rock Per
4.7.20.] ton add on 1000 $0.50 $500.00 0.50 $500.00 0.50 $500.00
TOTAL) $1,954,245.00 TOTAL $2,023,050.00 TOTAL $1,858,050.00
4.8. CHIP SEAL PRICING - FOB PLANT ONLY
4.8.1.| DESCRIPTION | Unit of Measure Tons UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PERT PERT PERT
APPROXIMATE QTY ON EXTENDED PRICE ON EXTENDED PRICE ON EXTENDED PRICE
SC.375 1,200 $10.87 $13,044.00 $15.00 $18,000.00 no bid $0.00
SC.5 7,500 $10.87 $81,525.00 $13.00 $97,500.00 no bid $0.00
TOTAL) $94,569.00 TOTAL) $115,500.00 TOTAL) $0.00




08-14FEB13 - Crushed Stone Aggregate and Chip Seal Products Term and Supply

BID TABULATION ConAgg of MO, LLC d/b/a Boone Quarries Mid-Missouri Limeston, Riggs Quarry Mid-Missouri Limeston, Millersburg Quarry
4.9. MAXIMUM % INCREASE FOR SECTIONS 4.7. AND 4.8.
Maximum % Increase 1st Renewal 10.00% 10% 10%
Maximum % Increase 2nd Renewal 10.00% 10% 10%
4.10. DELIVERY PRICING
Schedule A B C D E F G H 1 A B C D E F G H 1 A B C D E F G H 1
Fuel Price <$2.00 $2.00 -| $2.25 - $2.50 -| $2.75 -| $3.00- | $3.25 — | $3.50 — | $3.75 - <$2.00 $2.00 -| $2.25 - | $2.50 - [ $2.75 - | $3.00- | $3.25 - | $3.50 - | $3.75 - <$2.00 $2.00 - $2.25 - $2.50 - $2.75 - $3.00- $3.25 - $3.50 - $3.75 -
<2.25 | <2.50 | <2.75 | <3.00 | <3.00 | <3.50 | <3.75 | <4.00 <2.25 | <2.50 | <2.75 | <3.00 | <3.00 | <3.50 | <3.75 | <4.00 <2.25 <2.50 <2.75 <3.00 <3.00 <3.50 <3.75 <4.00
Distance (Miles) $/Ton $/Ton|$/Ton|$/Ton|$/Ton|$/Ton|$/Ton ($/Ton |$/Ton $/Ton $/Ton|$/ Ton|$/ Ton|$/ Ton|$/Ton|$/Ton [$/Ton |$/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton $/Ton
4.10.1,] 0-<5 $2.58 [$2.70 |$2.72 [$2.75 $2.42| $2.42| $2.42| $2.42| $2.42| $2.55| $2.68] $2.81 $2.94 $2.42 $2.42 $2.42 $2.42 $2.42 $2.55 $2.68 $2.81 $2.94
4.10.2.] 5-<10 $3.29 [$345 |$3.48 [$3.51 $3.12| $3.12| $3.12| $3.12| $3.12| $3.25] $3.38] $3.51 $3.64 $3.12 $3.12 $3.12 $3.12 $3.12 $3.25 $3.38 $3.51 $3.64]
4.10.3] 10 - <15 $3.77 [$3.95 [$3.99 [$4.02 $3.82| $3.82| $3.82| $3.82| $3.82| $3.95| $4.08] $4.21 $4.34 $3.82 $3.82 $3.82 $3.82 $3.82 $3.95 $4.08 $4.21 $4.34
4.10.4. 15-<20 $4.57 [$4.79 |$4.83 [$4.88 $4.52| $4.52| $4.52] $4.52| $4.52| $4.65] $4.75| $4.91 $5.04 $4.52 $4.52 $4.52 $4.52 $4.52 $4.65 $4.78 $4.91 $5.04]
4.10.5.] 20-<25 $5.31 [$5.57 |$5.62 [$5.67 $5.22| $5.22| $5.22| $5.22| $5.22| $5.35] $5.48] $5.61 $5.74 $5.22 $5.22 $5.22 $5.22 $5.22 $5.35 $5.48 $5.61 $5.74
4.10.6.] 25 - <30 $5.75 [$6.03 |$6.08 [$6.14 $5.92| $5.92| $5.92| $5.92| $5.92| $6.05] $6.18] $6.31 $6.44 $5.92 $5.92 $5.92 $5.92 $5.92 $6.05 $6.18 $6.31 $6.44]
4.10.7 | 30-<35 $6.64 [$6.96 $7.03  |$7.09 $6.62| $6.62| $6.62| $6.62| $6.62| $6.75] $6.88] $7.01 $7.14 $6.62 $6.62 $6.62 $6.62 $6.62 $6.75 $6.88 $7.01 $7.14
4.11. MAXIMUM % INCREASE FOR SECTION 4.10.
Maximum % Increase 1st Renewal 10.00% 10.00% 10.00%
Maximum % Increase 2nd Renewal 10.00% 10.00% 10.00%
4.12. East Scale - 3101 Creasy Springs Road Columbia, MO 65202
Location of Vendor Plant West Scale - 2510 N. Stadium Blvd., Columbia, MO 65202 Riggs Quarry Millersburg Quarry
Honor Pricing for New Plants during
4.13.[Contract Term? Y or N Y Y Y
4.14.|Cooperative Purchasing? Y or N Y Y Y
Provide material after normal Work Hours,
4.15.[Weekends & Holidays? Y or N Y Y Y




