MM®62 - Bituminous Material

BID TABULATION Missouri Petroleum Vance Brothers Coastal Energy Corp
ITEM NO.| QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION | DELIVERED | PICKED UP | PICKED UP | DELIVERED | PICKED UP | PICKED UP | DELIVERED | PICKED UP | PICKED UP
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL | PRICE/GAL
Full Full
Transport Full Transport Full Transport Full
Load Transport Transport Load Transport
Minimum | 3000 GAL Load Minimum | 3000 GAL Load Minimum | 3000 GAL Load
1 316,900 Gal CRS-2 $2.00 $1.84 $1.84] $2.30 $2.20 $2.20 $2.143 $2.263 $2.07]
2 10,000 Gal MC-3000 $2.95 $2.79 $2.79 $3.60 $3.50 $3.50 $3.143 $3.263 $3.07]
3 42,700 Gal PEP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65 $3.65 $2.46
1-Full Tanker
4 Load SS-1 $2.05 $1.89 $1.89 $2.30 $2.20 $2.20 $2.293 $2.41 $2.20
5 150,000 Gal CRS-2P $2.39 $2.23 $2.23 $2.60 $2.50 $2.50 $2.583 $2.69 $2.39
1-Full Tanker
6 Load MC-800 $2.97| $2.81 $2.81 $3.60 $3.50 $3.50 $3.32 $3.43 $3.23
1-Full Tanker
7 Load MC-30 $3.13 $2.97 $2.97] $3.75 $3.65 $3.65 $3.54 $3.64 $3.46
8 42,700 Gal AEP No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid| $2.59 $2.70 $2.50
9 150,000 Gal CHFRS2-P $2.40 $2.24 $2.24] $2.70 $2.60 $2.60) $2.799 $2.899 $2.69
Emulsified
10 316,900 Gal | Asphalt EA-90 $2.05 $1.89 $1.89 $2.40 $2.30 $2.30 $2.179 $2.289 $2.09
Emulsified
11 150,000 Gal | Asphalt EA-90P $2.44 $2.28 $2.28] $2.60 $2.50 $2.50) No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Demurrage
12 Per Hour Charge $80.00 $70.00 $70.00
Demurrage
Charge begins
13 after Hrs. 2 1.5 2
COOP? (YES OR NO) Yes No Yes
Delivery Days after Receipt of Order 1 1 2




