BID TABULATION  58-

Contech Engineered Solutions

04DEC12 - METAL 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA.
CULVERT PIPE TERM & |  Ppoly Poly Poly Poly Zinc Zinc Zinc Zinc Alum | Alum Alum Alum
SUPPLY Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated
4.8|Annular Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe
4.8.1.
12”7, L.F. $8.07 $6.67 $6.96 $5.80 $7.38 $6.15
4.8.2.112” Bands 12”
wide, each $12.11]  $10.00 $8.00 $6.67 $8.49 $9.23
4.8.3.112” Bands 24”
wide, each $16.40 $13.34 $13.92 $11.60 $14.76 $12.30)
4.8.4.
157, L.F. $10.00 $8.00 $8.70| $6.96 $9.22] $7.38
4.8.5.|15” Bands 12”
wide, each $15.000  $12.00 $13.05]  $10.44 $13.83 $11.07
15” Bands 24”
4.8.6.|wide, each $20.00 $16.00 $17.40 $13.92 $18.44 $14.76
4.8.7/18”, LF. $12.000  $10.01 $10.44 $8.70 $11.06 $9.22)
18” Bands 12”
4.8.8 |wide, each $18.00[  $15.02 $15.66]  $13.05 $16.59 $13.83
18” Bands 24”
4.8.9.|lwide, each $24.00 $20.02 $20.88 $17.40 $22.12 $18.44
4.8.10.|124”, L.F. $16.00 $12.67 $13.92 $11.02 $14.75 $11.68
24” Bands 12”
4.8.11.|wide, each $24.00  $19.01 $20.88]  $16.53 $22.13]  $17.52
24” Bands 24”
4.18.12.|wide, each $32.00 $25.34 $27.84 $22.04 $29.50 $23.36
4.8.1330”, LF. $27.35]  $20.01]  $16.01 $23.78 $17.40  $13.92 $25.21 $18.44 $14.76
30” Bands 12”
4.8.14.|wide, each $41.03 $30.01 $24.02 $35.67 $26.10 $20.88 $37.82 $27.66 $22.14
30” Bands 24”
4.8.15.|wide, each $54.70 $40.02 $32.02 $47.56 $34.80 $27.84 $50.42 $36.88 $29.52)
4.8.16.|36”, L.F. $32.68 $24.01 $19.34 $28.42 $20.88 $16.82 $30.13 $22.13 $17.83]
36” Bands 12”
4.8.17.|wide, each $49.02 $36.02 $29.01 $42.63 $31.32 $25.23 $45.20 $33.20 $26.75
36” Bands 24”
4.8.18.|wide, each $65.36 $48.02 $38.68 $56.84 $41.76 $33.64 $60.26 $44.26 $53.50)
4.8.19./148”, L.F. $54.69 $43.36 $32.02 $47.56 $37.70 $27.84 $50.41 $39.96 $29.51
48” Bands 12”
4.8.20.|wide, each $62.89 $65.04 $48.03 $71.34 $56.55 $41.76 $75.62 $59.94 $44.27




Contech Engineered Solutions

BID TABULATION  58-
04DEC12 - METAL 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA.
CULVERT PIPE TERM & |  Ppoly Poly Poly Poly Zinc Zinc Zinc Zinc Alum | Alum Alum Alum
SUPPLY Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated
48” Bands 24”
4.8.21.|wide, each $109.38 $86.72 $64.04 $95.12 $75.40 $55.68 $100.82, $119.88 $88.54
4.8.22.|154”, L.F. $62.95 $49.96 $36.95 $54.74 $43.44 $32.13 $58.02 $46.05 $34.06
54” Bands 12”
4.8.23.|wide, each $94.42 $74.94 $55.43 $62.95 $65.16 $48.20 $87.03 $69.08 $51.09
54” Bands 24”
4.8.24.|wide, each $125.90 $99.92 $73.90 $109.48 $86.88 $64.26 $116.04 $92.10 $68.12
4.8.25.160”, L.F. $86.17 $67.18 $48.93 $74.93 $58.42 $42.55 $79.43 $61.93 $45.10
60” Bands,
4.8.26.|each $129.25 $77.26 $73.40 $112.40] $87.63 $48.93 $91.35 $92.89 $51.87
60” Diameter
4.8.27.|Bands, 48” $172.34 $134.36 $97.86 $149.86 $116.84 $85.10 $158.86, $123.86 $103.74
4.8.28./66”, L.F. $94.21]  $73.75|  $54.04 $81.92 $64.13]  $46.99 $86.84  $67.99]  $49.81
66” Bands,
4.8.29.|each $141.32 $110.63 $62.15 $94.21 $73.75 $54.04 $130.26 $101.99 $74.72
66" Diameter
4.8.30.|Bands, 48” $188.42 $147.50] $108.08 $122.88 $128.26 $93.98 $173.68 $135.98 $99.62
4.831.[72”, LF. $102.24]  $80.33]  $59.16 $88.90 $69.85 $51.44 $94.23|  $74.04]  $54.53
72” Bands,
4.8.32.]each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid
72” Diameter
4.8.33.|Bands, 48” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid
4.8.34.|184”, LF.3x 1 $93.47 $68.64 $56.23 $81.28 $59.69 $48.90 $86.16 $60.09 $51.83
84” Bands,
4.8.35.]each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 Diameter
4.8.36.|Bands, 48” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.8.37.196”, LF.3x 1 $107.35 $78.13 $63.53 $93.35 $67.94 $55.24 $98.95 $72.02 $58.55




BID TABULATION  58-

Contech Engineered Solutions

04DEC12 - METAL 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. [ 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA.
CULVERT PIPE TERM & |  Ppoly Poly Poly Poly Zinc Zinc Zinc Zinc Alum | Alum Alum Alum
SUPPLY Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated
96” Bands,
4.8.38.]each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96” Diameter
4.8.39.|Bands, 48” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108", L.F. 3 x
4.8.40.]1 $120.50] $87.63|No Bid $104.78 $76.20|No Bid $111.07 $80.77|No Bid
108” bands,
4.8.41.|each $30.63 $22.41 $17.93 $26.63 $19.49 $15.59 $28.24] $20.65 $16.53
35” x 24” R.E.
4.8.42.|L.F. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35" x24”, RE.
4.8.43.|Bands, each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
49” x 33”, R.E.
4.8.44.|LF. (42" $42.59 $31.37 $25.40, $37.03 $27.28 $22.09 $39.25 $28.92 $23.42
49” x 33”, R.E.
4.8.45.|Bands, each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
64” x 43”7, R.E.
4.8.46.|L.F. (54" $63.29 $44.17|No Bid $51.92 $38.41|No Bid $55.03 $40.72|No Bid
Totals:|1,424.18 [1,838.92 |1,552.01 [490.25 1,166.29 |1,593.90 |1,331.82 [424.28 1,302.59 [1,753.43 |1,468.99 |469.77
Lifting Lugs, * Vendor
4.8.47.|each $35.00 note |Bands: 12" wide 1.5' of pipe 24" wide 2' of pipe
4.8.48.| Arching fee for unspecified arch sizes: Add 12 % per base bid price of round pipe and bands.
Mitered ends:
Round Pipe
Diameter |Price per [*Vendor
4.8.49. (inches) Cut ($) note Price would depend on qty of pipe
4.8.49.1. 12 No Bid
4.8.49.2. 15 No Bid
4.8.49.3. 18 No Bid




BID TABULATION  58-

Contech Engineered Solutions

04DEC12 - METAL 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA. | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA. | 16GA.
CULVERT PIPE TERM & |  Ppoly Poly Poly Poly Zinc Zinc Zinc Zinc Alum | Alum Alum Alum
SUPPLY Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated | Coated
4.8.49.4. 24 No Bid
4.8.49.5. 30 No Bid
4.8.49.6. 36 No Bid
4.8.49.7. 48 No Bid
4.8.49.8. 54 No Bid
4.8.49.9. 60 No Bid
4.8.49.10. 66 No Bid
4.8.49.11. 72 No Bid
4.8.49.12. 84 No Bid
4.8.49.13. 96 No Bid
4.8.49.14. 108 No Bid
TOTAL: $0.00
Coop
Purchasing (Y
4.9. or N)
4.10. Delivery ARO |2 weeks
Max %
Increase 2nd
4.11 Year

Max %
Increase 3rd
Year




Metal Culverts, Inc.

BID TABU
04DEC124 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Poly | 16GA.Poly | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14 GA. Zinc 16 GA.Zinc | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Alum | 16 GA. Alum
CULVERT|  poly Poly Coated Coated Zinc Zinc Coated Coated Alum Alum Coated Coated
SUPPLY | Coated [ Coated Coated | Coated Coated | Coated
4.8
4.8.1)
$10.98 $8.99 $8.40, $6.68 $9.13 $7.30)
4.8.2]
$16.47 $13.49 $12.60, $10.02 $13.70, $10.95
4.8.3]
$21.96 $17.98 $16.80, $13.36 $18.26 $14.60)
4.8.4)
$13.92 $11.31 $10.65 $8.40, $11.57 $9.18
4.8.5]
$20.88 $16.97 $15.98 $12.60, $17.36 $13.77
4.8.6. $27.84 $22.62 $21.30, $16.80, $23.14] $18.36
4.8.7 $16.46 $13.43 $12.60, $9.98 $13.69 $10.91
4.8.8. $24.69 $20.15 $18.90, $14.97 $20.54] $16.37
4.8.9, $32.92 $26.86 $25.20, $19.96 $27.38 $21.82
4.8.10, $21.95 $17.98 $16.80, $13.35 $18.26 $14.60)
4.8.11) $32.93 $26.97 $25.20, $20.03 $27.39 $21.90)
4.18.12, $43.90 $35.96 $33.60) $26.70, $36.52 $29.20)
4.8.13) $37.06 $26.95 $22.02 $28.95 $20.65 $16.35 $31.27 $22.41 $17.88
4.8.14) $55.59 $40.43 $33.03 $43.43 $30.98 $24.53 $46.91 $33.62 $26.82
4.8.15) $74.12 $53.90 $44.04] $57.90| $41.30, $32.70, $62.54] $44.82 $35.76]
4.8.16, $44.16 $32.14 $26.26 $34.50] $24.60, $19.50, $37.26 $26.73 $21.32
4.8.17, $66.24] $48.21 $39.39 $51.75 $36.90| $29.25 $55.89 $40.10, $31.98]
4.8.18, $88.32 $64.28 $52.52 $69.00| $49.20, $39.00| $74.52 $53.46 $42.644
4.8.19, $75.26 $58.94 $42.92 $58.80 $46.05 $32.85 $63.50 $49.73 $35.70]
4.8.20, $112.89 $88.41 $64.38 $88.20 $69.08 $49.28 $95.25 $74.60, $53.55




Metal Culverts, Inc.

BID TABU
04DEC124 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Poly | 16GA.Poly | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14 GA. Zinc 16 GA.Zinc | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Alum | 16 GA. Alum
CULVERT Poly Poly Coated Coated Zinc Zinc Coated Coated Alum Alum Coated Coated
SUPPLY | Coated [ Coated Coated | Coated Coated | Coated
4.8.21, $150.52 $117.88 $85.84 $117.60 $92.10)| $65.70 $127.00 $99.46 $107.10,
4.8.22, $85.82] $67.02 $48.90 $67.05 $52.50 $37.43 $72.41 $56.70| $40.67
4.8.23. $128.73 $100.53 $73.35 $100.58 $78.75 $56.15 $108.62 $85.05 $61.01
4.8.24. $171.64 $134.04 $97.80 $134.10 $105.00] $74.86 $144.82 $113.40, $81.34
4.8.25. $94.56 $74.02 $54.33 $73.88 $57.83 $41.59 $79.79 $62.45 $45.19
4.8.26. $141.84 $111.03 $81.50 $110.82 $86.75 $62.39 $119.69 $93.68 $67.79
4.8.27. $567.36 $444.12 $325.98 $443.28 $346.98 $249.54 $478.74 $374.70, $271.14]
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.28, $103.68 $81.22[requirements $81.00 $63.45[requirements $87.48 $68.53|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.29 $155.52[  $121.83|requirements $121.50 $95.18|requirements $131.22[  $102.80|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.30 $622.08 $487.32|requirements $486.00[  $380.70|requirements $524.88 $411.18|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.31, $112.90 $89.18|requirements $88.20 $69.68|requirements $95.26 $75.25|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.32] $169.35 $133.77|requirements $132.30[  $104.52|requirements $142.89]  $112.88|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.33, $677.40  $535.08|requirements $529.20[  $418.08|requirements $571.56]  $451.50|requirements
4.8.34. $123.73 $89.96 $74.90| $95.83 $68.77 $56.00| $103.11 $74.39 $60.90]
4.8.35. $247.46 $179.92 $149.80, $191.66 $137.54] $112.00] $206.22 $148.78 $121.80)
4.8.36. $742.38 $539.76 $449.40, $574.98 $412.62 $336.00 $618.66 $446.34 $365.40)
4.8.37. $141.17 $102.65 $85.28 $109.34 $78.47 $63.76 $117.64 $84.83 $69.34




Metal Culverts, Inc.

BID TABU
04DEC124 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Poly | 16GA.Poly | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14 GA. Zinc 16 GA.Zinc | 10GA. | 12GA. | 14GA.Alum | 16 GA. Alum
CULVERT Poly Poly Coated Coated Zinc Zinc Coated Coated Alum Alum Coated Coated
SUPPLY | Coated [ Coated Coated | Coated Coated | Coated
4.8.38. $282.34 $205.30 $170.56 $218.68 $156.94 $127.52 $235.28 $169.76 $138.68]
4.8.39. $847.02 $615.90 $513.48 $656.04 $470.82 $382.56 $705.84 $509.28 $416.04]
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.40 $158.20, $125.02[requirements $122.53 $95.56[requirements $131.84] $103.37|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.841, $316.40 $250.04{requirements $254.06 $191.12[requirements $263.68 $206.74{requirements
4.8.42. $39.64 $28.88 $23.54] $30.98 $22.07 $17.49 $33.46 $23.98 $19.13
4.8.43. $59.46 $43.32] $35.31 $46.47 $33.11 $26.24] $50.19 $35.97 $28.70)
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.44. $55.36 $40.32[requirements $43.25 $30.82[requirements $46.72 $33.49|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.45. $83.04] $60.48|requirements $64.88 $46.23|requirements $70.08 $50.24|requirements
Ga. doesn't meet |Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet [Ga. doesn't meet Ga. doesn't meet [Ga. doesn't meet
H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load H20 live load
4.8.46. $71.89|requirements requirements $56.18|requirements requirements $60.67|requirements requirements
3,369.55 [6,177.97 |3,707.36 1,952.24 2,632.51 [4,817.06 |2,835.52 1,455.75 2,843.11 [5,183.69 |3,108.74 1,585.35
4.8.47]%$75.00
4.8.48.]7.00%
Price per
4.8.49|Cut ($)
4.8.49.1 $35.75
4.8.49.2 $45.00
4.8.49.3 $55.25




Metal Culverts, Inc.

glggé?zu' 10 GA. 12 GA. 14 GA. Poly 16 GA. Poly 10 GA. 12 GA. 14 GA. Zinc 16 GA. Zinc 10 GA. 12 GA. 14 GA. Alum 16 GA. Alum
CULVERT|  poly Poly Coated Coated Zinc Zinc Coated Coated Alum Alum Coated Coated
SUPPLY | Coated | Coated Coated | Coated Coated | Coated
4.8.49.4, $75.20
4.8.49.5, $92.50
4.8.49.6. $110.10
4.8.49.7, $161.55
4.8.49.8, $182.85
4.8.49.9, $205.90
4.8.49.10, $250.00
4.8.49.11) $277.00
4.8.49.12) $368.50
4.8.49.13] $431.25
4.8.49.14) $487.00
TOTAL:] $2,777.85
4.9. Y
4.10. 21 Days
4.11 10
4.11 10




