MD DocC - MO
55-21NOV12 - Regulatory Signs Term & Supply J&A Traffic Lightle MTS Safety Solutions, |Custom Osburn Vocational
Bid Tabulation SIZE DISCRIPTION Products Rocal Inc. Vulcan Signs Enterprises |Products Inc. Products Corp. |Signotech Associates Enterprises
4.8. CATEGORY A: TRAFFIC SIGNS
REGULATORY, WARNING AND TEMPORARY
4.8.1 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS
4.8.1.1 STOP 36X36 R1- No Bid 37.44 32.53 42.84 73.57|No Bid 34.33 68.45 36.00 60.50
4.81.2 STOP 30X30 R1-1 No Bid 26.00 22.69 27.50 41.81|No Bid 22.90 51.12 25.00 48.15
4.8.1.3 YEILD 36X36X36 [R1-2 No Bid 18.22 16.21 21.42 41.53|No Bid 16.51 68.45 20.00 65.00
4.8.1.4 YEILD 48x48X48 |R1-2 No Bid 30.83 28.43 38.08 137.93|No Bid 34.49 120.15 33.00 86.50
4.8.1.5 ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 6X12 No Bid 4.08 2.55 2.38 8.17[No Bid 2.78 9.92 2.05 2.30
4.8.1.6 ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 12X36 No Bid 12.48 11.61 14.28 29.67|No Bid 12.28 27.80 12.38 13.75
4.8.1.7 ONE COLOR MUTCD DOUBLE FACED 12X36 No Bid 23.28 21.49 14.28 29.67|No Bid 17.81 46.05 12.38 19.10
4.8.1.8 ALL WAY 18X6 No Bid 5.12 3.30 3.57 8.02|No Bid 4.16 11.91 3.08 3.50
4.8.1.9 ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 18X18 No Bid 9.36 8.89 10.71 23.19[No Bid 9.87 22.96 9.23 10.35
4.8.1.10 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 18X24 No Bid 12.48 11.50 14.28 22.12|No Bid 12.28 28.31 12.38 13.75
4.8.1.11  |ONE COLOR MUTCD DOUBLE FACED 18X24 No Bid 23.28 20.33 14.28 25.90{No Bid 17.81 46.42 12.38 19.10
4.8.1.12 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 24X12 No Bid 8.32 7.92 9.52 21.02|No Bid 8.75 12.35 8.20 9.20
4.8.1.13 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 24X18 No Bid 12.48 11.50 14.28 28.28[No Bid 12.28 28.31 12.38 13.75
4.8.1.14 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 24X24 No Bid 16.64 15.29 19.04 43.12|No Bid 16.36 34.97 16.40 18.50
4.8.1.15 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 24X30 No Bid 20.80 19.08 23.80 47.02|No Bid 20.38 42.87 20.50 22.95
4.8.1.16  |ONE COLOR MUTCD DOUBLE FACED 24X30 No Bid 38.80 33.39 23.80 47.02|No Bid 29.55 70.52 20.50 31.80
4.8.1.17 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30X24 No Bid 20.80 19.08 23.80 47.02|No Bid 20.38 42.87 20.50 22.95
4.8.1.18 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30X30 No Bid 26.00 23.66 29.75 48.64[No Bid 24.78 52.55 25.03 32.85
4.8.1.19 |TWO  COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30X30 No Bid 27.88 24.47 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.28 67.30 25.03 43.90
4.8.1.20 |THREE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30X30 No Bid 31.38 24.66 29.75 48.64[No Bid 30.25 72.55 28.00 54.95
4.8.1.21 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30 DIA No Bid 26.00 23.66 29.75 56.95[No Bid 24.78 52.55 25.03 32.85
4.8.1.22 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 30X36 No Bid 31.20 28.61 35.70 60.00{No Bid 29.74 61.42 30.75 39.40
4.8.1.23 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36X8 No Bid 8.32 7.95 9.52(No Bid No Bid 10.87 20.87 8.20 10.60
4.8.1.24 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36X12 No Bid 12.48 11.61 14.28 29.67|No Bid 12.28 27.97 12.38 15.75
4.8.1.25 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36X24 No Bid 24.96 22.97 28.56 49.05[No Bid 23.73 42.87 24.00 31.50
4.8.1.26  |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36X36 No Bid 37.44 33.81 42.84 82.46|No Bid 35.41 70.51 36.90 47.25
4.8.1.27 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36 DIA No Bid 37.44 33.81 42.84|No Bid No Bid 35.41 70.51 36.90 47.25
4.8.1.28 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 48X30 No Bid 41.60 37.68 47.60 91.60{No Bid 39.34 79.23 41.00 52.50
4.8.1.29 |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 60X30 No Bid 52.00 46.83 59.50 114.33|No Bid 49.05 95.46 51.25 65.60
4.8.1. Totals $0.00 $677.11 $605.51 $717.70 $1,305.04 $0.00 $634.84 $1,447.22 $620.83 $935.55
4.8.2 YELLOW/GREEN FLUORESCENT SCHOOL
4.8.2.1 SCHOOL CROSSING 30X30 S1-1 No Bid 39.75 32.07 48.82 76.91[No Bid 39.90 71.91 35.93 85.00
4.8.2.2 SCHOOL CROSSING 36X36 S1-1 No Bid 57.24 48.62 70.30 82.26{No Bid 57.19 98.40 51.75 121.35
4.8.2.3 AHEAD OR ARROWS 24X12 W16 SERIES No Bid 12.72 12.14 15.62|No Bid No Bid 13.59 26.91 11.50 26.95
4.8.2.4 SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD 30X30 S3-1 No Bid 39.75 36.89 48.82 76.91[No Bid 41.40 71.91 35.93 85.00
4.8.2.5 SCHOOL BUS TURN AROUND AHEAD 30X30 S3-2 No Bid 39.75 36.41 48.82 76.91[No Bid 39.90 71.91 35.93 85.00
4.8.2.6 SCHOOL SPEED ZONE AHEAD 30X30 S4-5 No Bid 39.75 41.27 48.82 76.91[No Bid 48.50 71.91 35.93 85.00
4.8.2. Totals $0.00 $228.96 $207.40 $281.20 $389.90 $0.00 $240.48 $412.95 $206.97 $488.30
SPECIAL DESIGN SIGNS
4.8.3 (Layouts in Attachment A)
4.8.3.1 DO NOT ENTER WHEN FLOODED 24X30 BLACK/WHITE No Bid 39.35 22.35 23.80 50.36{No Bid 21.75 42.87 20.50 30.45
4.8.3.2 FLOOD AREA AHEAD 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64|No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.3 IMPASSIBLE DURING HIGH WATER 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW  |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.4 CAUTION 30X30 BLACK /ORANGE |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64|No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.5 FRESH OIL LOOSE GRAVEL 30X30 BLACK/ORANGE |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.6 BOONE COUNTY MAINTENANCE BEGINS 18X12 BLACK /WHITE No Bid 11.81 8.79 7.14 18.00|No Bid 7.08 16.62 6.50 12.00
4.8.3.7 BOONE COUNTY MAINTENANCE ENDS 18X12 BLACK/WHITE No Bid 11.81 8.79 7.14 18.00|No Bid 7.08 16.62 6.50 12.00
4.8.3.8 W1-1R WITH SIDE INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.9 W1-1R WITH CORNER INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW  |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.10 |W1-1R WITH FORWARD INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.11  |W1-1L WITH SIDE INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW  |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
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4.8.3.12 |W1-1L WITH CORNER INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.13  |W1-1L WITH FORWARD INTERSECTION 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW  |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64[No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.14 |[W20-4 SPECIAL 30X30 BLACK/YELLOW |No Bid 49.19 27.11 29.75 48.64|No Bid 26.49 49.41 25.63 43.90
4.8.3.15 |DNR PERMIT SIGN 18X24 BLACK/WHITE No Bid 23.61 14.45 14.28|No Bid No Bid 13.11 26.81 12.38 20.65
4.8.3. Totals 0.00 $627.67 $352.59 $379.61 $621.40 $0.00 $340.41 $646.43 $327.81 $558.00
Section 4.8. Totals $0.00 $1,533.74 $1,165.50 $1,378.51 $2,316.34 $0.00 $1,215.73 $2,506.60 $1,155.61 $1,981.85
1st Increase 50.00 $1,610.43 1,223.78 1,447.44 b2,432.16 $0.00 1,361.62 2,556.73 1,271.17 2,001.67
2nd Increase 0.00 1,690.95 $1,284.96 $1,519.81 2,553.76 50.00 b1,525.01 $2,607.87 51,398.29 52,041.70
3rd Increase 50.00 $1,775.50 1,349.21 1,595.80 b2,681.45 0.00 1,708.01 $2,660.02 1,538.12 2,143.79
Total 4 year contract cost 0.00 6,610.61 b5,023.45 b5,941.55 $9,983.71 50.00 b5,810.37 $10,331.22 b5,363.19 b8,169.01
4.9. CATEGORY B: FABRICATION MATERIALS
4.9.1 SIGN FACING SHEETS
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.1 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 12X 18 No Bid 2.82 2.37 3.08|No Bid No Bid 2.75 11.40 2.31 3.60
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.91.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 12 X 36 No Bid 4.74 6.15[No Bid No Bid 5.25 17.68 2.31 7.20
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.3 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 18 X 18 No Bid 4.23 3.56 4.61|No Bid No Bid 4.28 14.56 3.47 5.40
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.4 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 18 X 24 No Bid 5.64 4.74 6.15[No Bid No Bid 5.25 17.70 4.12 7.20
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.91.5 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 24" STOP No Bid 7.52 6.32 8.20[No Bid No Bid 6.78 21.91 6.16 9.60
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.6 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 24 X 30 No Bid 9.40 7.90 10.25|No Bid No Bid 8.69 26.11 7.70 12.00
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.91.7 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 30" STOP No Bid 11.75 9.88 12.81|No Bid No Bid 10.08 31.36 9.63 15.00
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.8 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 30 X 30 No Bid 11.75 9.88 12.81|No Bid No Bid 10.47 31.36 9.63 15.00
TWO COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.9 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 30 X 30 No Bid 13.50 10.63 12.81|No Bid No Bid 11.54 46.11 9.75 22.15
THREE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.10 |PRESSURE SENSITIVE 30 X 30 No Bid 17.69 11.34 15.94 62.95(No Bid 16.30 52.11 10.25 33.20
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.11 |PRESSURE SENSITIVE 36 X 36 No Bid 16.92 14.22 18.45 82.26{No Bid 14.83 42.91 13.86 21.65
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.12 |PRESSURE SENSITIVE 36" YEILD No Bid 7.72 6.55 9.23 43.19(No Bid 7.15 42.91 7.70 18.00
ONE COLOR SIGN FACE, HI REFLECTIVITY,
4.9.1.13 |PRESSURE SENSITIVE 36" STOP No Bid 16.92 14.22 18.45 74.09(No Bid 14.28 42.91 13.86 21.65
4.9.1. Totals $0.00 $123.04 $99.24 $129.71 $262.49 $0.00 $117.65 $399.03 $100.75 $191.65
4.9.2 CUTTER/ PLOTTER MATERIALS
HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC SHEETING, 24 IN X 3M 3930 SERIES
4.9.2.1 PRESSURE SENSITIVE, ELCTRO CUT 50 YDS OR EQUIV No Bid 414.00 396.00 426.30|No Bid No Bid 471.30 525.00 372.00{No Bid
HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC SHEETING, 30 IN X 3M 3930 SERIES
4.9.2.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE, ELCTRO CUT 50 YDS OR EQUIV No Bid 517.50 495.00 532.88 1433.19|No Bid 589.13 656.25 465.00{No Bid
TRANSPARENT OVERLAY FILM, ELECTRO-CUT, (24 IN X 3M 1170 SERIES
4.9.2.3 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 50 YDS OR EQUIV No Bid 321.00 324.00 408.00 755.95|No Bid 350.29(No Bid 300.00{No Bid
TRANSPARENT OVERLAY FILM, ELECTRO-CUT, (30 IN X 3M 1170 SERIES
4.9.2.4 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 50 YDS OR EQUIV No Bid 401.25 405.00 510.00 945.00|No Bid 437.86|No Bid 375.00{No Bid
ANTI-GRAFFITI PROTECTIVE OVERLAY FILM, [24 IN X 3M 1150
4.9.2.5 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 50 YDS EQUIVILENT No Bid 342.00 354.00 421.80 853.85|No Bid 375.00 579.38 180.00|No Bid
ANTI-GRAFFITI PROTECTIVE OVERLAY FILM, (30 IN X 3M 1150
4.9.2.6 PRESSURE SENSITIVE 50 YDS EQUIVILENT No Bid 427.50 442.50 527.25 956.90|No Bid 468.75 724.23 225.00{No Bid
NON-REFLECTIVE VINYL, PRESSURE 24 IN X 3M 7725 SERIES
4.9.2.7 SENSITIVE, ELECTRO-CUT GRAFIC FILM 50 YDS EQUIVILENT No Bid 393.00 336.17 405.00 579.31|No Bid 323.58 385.31 255.00{No Bid
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TRANSFER TAPE, CLEAR, GRAFFIC 24 IN X 3M TPM5 ECF
4.9.2.8 APPLICATION FOR ELECTRO-CUT FILM 50 YDS EQUIVILENT No Bid 229.79 78.38 135.00|No Bid No Bid 254.12 236.25 192.00|No Bid
TRANSFER TAPE, CLEAR, GRAFFIC 30 IN X 3M TPM5 ECF
4.9.2.9 APPLICATION FOR ELECTRO-CUT FILM 50 YDS EQUIVILENT No Bid 287.23 97.98 168.75|No Bid No Bid 317.65[No Bid 209.00{No Bid
4.9.2. Totals $0.00 $3,333.27 $2,929.03 $3,534.98 $5,524.20 $0.00 $3,587.68 $3,106.42 $2,573.00 $0.00
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4.9.3 SIGN BLANKS
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 18 X 6,

4.9.3.1 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 4.64 4.78 4.03 13.28|No Bid 5.36 7.50 4.05 4.75
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 18 X9,

4.9.3.2 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 6.99 7.16 6.46 17.78|No Bid 8.58 9.92 6.05 7.20
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [21 X6,

4.9.3.3 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 5.45) 5.65 5.02 15.78|No Bid 7.10 8.17 4.75 5.60
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [24 X

4.9.34 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 6,0.080 ga No Bid 6.19 6.35 5.74 16.78|No Bid 7.15 8.96 5.16 6.40
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [24 X9,

4.9.3.5 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 9.29 9.40 8.61 23.79|No Bid 10.55 12.09 8.10 9.60
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [27 X 6,

4.9.3.6 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 6.99 7.25 6.46 19.40|No Bid 8.94 9.76 6.25 7.20
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [30 X 6,

4.9.3.7 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 7.74 7.87 8.61 19.43[No Bid 8.94 10.72 6.75 8.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [30 X9,

4.9.3.8 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 11.64] 11.72 10.76) 28.79|No Bid 13.19 14.72 12.15 12.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [33 X6,

4.9.3.9 FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 9.37 9.74 8.65 21.00|No Bid 11.40 13.00 8.50 14.40
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [36 X6,

4.9.3.10 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 10.19 10.52 9.43 22.93[No Bid 11.40 13.94 8.85 10.50
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [36 X9,

4.9.3.11 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 15.28] 15.60 14.15 36.44|No Bid 17.14 19.84 13.28 15.75
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, (36 X 12,

4.9.3.12 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga, No Bid 20.37 20.84 18.87 40.00[{No Bid 22.13 24.37| 17.70 21.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [42 X6,

4.9.3.13 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 11.88] 12.42 11.01 49.00(No Bid 13.30 15.82 10.33 12.25
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [42 X9,

4.9.3.14 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 17.86) 18.35 16.51 43.25[No Bid 20.00 23.87| 15.41 18.40
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, [42 X 12,

4.9.3.15 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 23.77 23.58 22.01 50.00|No Bid 26.66 29.69 20.13 24.50
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [48 X 6,

4.9.3.16 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 13.58] 14.19 12.58[No Bid No Bid 15.26) 17.69 11.80 14.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [48 X9,

4.9.3.17 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 20.37 20.88 18.87[No Bid No Bid 22.73 25.32 17.70 21.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [48 X 12,

4.9.3.18 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 27.16 26.91 25.16 50.00|No Bid 30.31 31.58 23.60 28.00
ALUM, TWO-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC,  [54 X9,

4.9.3.19 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 22.95 23.47| 21.23|No Bid No Bid 26.12 28.75 19.88 23.65
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 30 X 12,

4.9.3.20 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.080 ga No Bid 10.75 15.60 10.39 33.00|No Bid 9.82 16.42 10.00 17.50
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 36 X 12,

4.9.3.21 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 12.90 12.99 14.12 36.21[No Bid 15.90 18.58 13.50 21.00
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 42X 12,

4.9.3.22 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 17.12) 15.16) 16.48[No Bid No Bid 18.55 21.27| 15.75 24.50
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 48 X 12,

4.9.3.23 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 19.56 17.32 18.83[No Bid No Bid 20.88 23.89 10.00 28.00
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 54 X 12,

4.9.3.24 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 22.01 19.49 21.18|No Bid No Bid 23.48 26.55 20.25 31.50
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 60 X 12,

4.9.3.25 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 24.45 21.65 23.54{No Bid No Bid 26.09 29.20 22.50 35.00
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 66 X 12,

4.9.3.26 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 26.90 23.82 25.89[No Bid No Bid 28.71 31.85 24.75 38.50
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 72X 12,

4.9.3.27 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 29.34 25.98 28.24|No Bid No Bid 31.32 34.51 27.00 42.00
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ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 78 X 12,
4.9.3.28 |FLAT STREET,1.5" CORNER RADIUS 0.100 ga No Bid 31.79 28.15 30.60[No Bid No Bid 33.93 37.17 29.25 45.50
ALUM, ONE-SIDED WHITE HIGH PRISMATIC, 36 X 24,
4.9.3.29 [TWO HOLES CENTERED, SIGN BLANK 0.080 ga No Bid 25.80 22.97| 24.94] 49.05[No Bid 22.13 26.92 24.00 42.00
4.9.3. Totals $0.00 $472.33 $459.81 $448.37| $585.91 $0.00 $517.07| $592.07| $417.44 $589.70
Section 4.9. Totals $0.00 $3,928.64 $3,488.08 $4,113.06 $6,372.60 $0.00 $4,222.40 $4,097.52 $3,091.19 $781.35
1st Increase $0.00 $4,125.07 $3,662.48 $4,318.71 $6,691.23 $0.00 $4,729.09 $4,179.47 $3,400.31 $789.16
2nd Increase $0.00 $4,331.32 $3,845.61 $4,534.65 $7,025.79 $0.00 $5,296.58 $4,263.06 $3,740.34 $804.95
3rd Increase, $0.00 $4,547.89 $4,037.89 $4,761.38 $7,377.08 $0.00 $5,932.17 $4,348.32 $4,114.37 $845.19
Total 4 year contract cost $0.00 $16,932.92 $15,034.06| $17,727.80 $27,466.70 $0.00 $20,180.23 $16,888.37 $14,346.21 $3,220.65
4.10. CATEGORY C: WORK ZONE SUPPLIES
4.10.1 BARRICADES
TYPE Il, DOUBLE SIDED, PLASTIC, 8" BOARD, 4"
4.10.1.1  |STRIPE, HIGH INTENSITY REFLECTIVITY 24" X 45" 52.50(No Bid 69.88 48.90|No Bid No Bid 62.46|No Bid 89.95|No Bid
TYPE Ill, DOUBLE SIDED, PLASTIC, 8" BOARD, 6"
4.10.1.2 |STRIPE, HIGH INTENSITY REFLECTIVITY 8' X5 213.00|No Bid 188.50 187.50|No Bid No Bid 233.71[No Bid 231.55[No Bid
4.10.1.3 |BARRICADE LIGHT, LED, PHOTOELECTRIC 15.95[No Bid 17.95 13.75[No Bid No Bid 24.00|No Bid 49.75[No Bid
BARRICADE TAPE, HI REFLECTIVITY, W/
4.10.1.4 |4"STRIPE 8" X 50YDS 255.00|No Bid 172.14 157.30 296.71[No Bid 169.41[No Bid 140.00{No Bid
BARRICADE TAPE, HI REFLECTIVITY, W/
4.10.1.5 |6"STRIPE 8" X 50YDS 255.00|No Bid 172.14 157.30 296.71[No Bid 169.41[No Bid 140.00{No Bid
TRAFFIC CONE, WEIGHTED, WITH TWO 28 INCHES
4.10.1.6 |REFLECTIVE COLLARS TALL 17.50|No Bid 13.17] 12.70 18.13|No Bid 13.53|No Bid 13.09|No Bid
4.10.1.7 |REFLECTIVE CONE COLLAR 6" 9.75[No Bid 3.75 2.92(No Bid No Bid 313.73[No Bid 6.50|No Bid
4.10.1.8 |REFLECTIVE CONE COLLAR 4" 8.75|No Bid 3.75 2.92|No Bid No Bid 324.56(No Bid 3.50|No Bid
4.10.1. Totals $827.45 $0.00 $641.28 $583.29 $611.55 $0.00 $1,310.81 $0.00 $674.34 $0.00
ROLL-UP COLLAPSIBLE SIGN, HIGH
4.10.2 REFLECTIVE VINYL, WITH RIBS AND POCKETS
4.10.2.1  |ONE COLOR MUTCD STANDARD 36X36 82.50(No Bid 95.00 73.33 68.97|No Bid 107.93|No Bid 39.00{No Bid
4.10.2.2 |FRESH OIL LOOSE GRAVEL 36X36 82.50|No Bid 95.00 73.33 68.97[No Bid 107.93|No Bid 38.00{No Bid
4.10.2. Totals $165.00 $0.00 $190.00 $146.66 $137.94 $0.00 $215.86 $0.00 $77.00 $0.00
4.10.3 MISCELLANEOUS
4.10.3.1  |WARNING FLAGS, MESH, W/ WOOD STAFF 24" X 24" 6.50(No Bid 4.40 5.40(No Bid No Bid 4.18|No Bid 7.95[No Bid
4.10.3.2 |STOP/SLOW PADDLE KITS, W/ 60"STAFF 18 x 18 56.75|No Bid 22.23 45.65 30.74[No Bid 23.31|No Bid 29.95 37.50
4.10.3.3 |BARRIER TAPE, CAUTION, 3 MIL (min) 3" X 1000' 14.90|No Bid 21.45 11.95 8.62[No Bid 10.27|No Bid 12.00|No Bid
4.10.3. Totals $78.15 $0.00 $48.08 $63.00 $39.36 $0.00 $37.76 $0.00 $49.90 $37.50
Section 4.10. Totals $1,070.60 $0.00 $879.36 $792.95 $788.85 $0.00 $1,564.43 $0.00 $801.24 $37.50
1st Increase, $1,070.60 $0.00 $923.33 5832.60 $828.29 $0.00 $1,752.16 50.00 $881.36 $37.88
2nd Increase $1,102.72 50.00 969.49 874.23 $869.71 50.00 $1,962.42 0.00 969.50 38.63
3rd Increase $1,157.85 50.00 $1,017.97 $917.94 $913.19 50.00 $2,197.91 50.00 $1,066.45 $40.56
Total 4 year contract cost 54,401.77 50.00 $3,790.15 $3,417.71 $3,400.04 50.00 57,476.92 0.00 $3,718.55 $154.57
4.11. CATEGORY D: MISC HARDWARE & POSTS
41141 HARDWARE
4.11.1.1  |BREAK-AWAY NUT, ALUM, NBA 5/16 PER 100 52.00|No Bid 45.00 60.88|No Bid 42.00 68.00({No Bid 89.00{No Bid
4.11.1.2  |SIGN SAVER, ALUM, 3"min PER 100 62.00{No Bid 95.00 55.00 103.00 110.00 20.00{No Bid 74.00{No Bid
4.11.1.3 |SET SCREW, KNURLED, 5/16", w/5/32 SOCKET |PER 100 34.00|No Bid 27.00 11.50{No Bid 6.00 26.00|No Bid 25.00|No Bid
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, [12"
4.11.1.4 |90 DEGREE HOLDER 14.50|No Bid 11.05 7.88 16.39 8.80 8.95[No Bid 8.00[No Bid
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, (5 1/2"
4.11.1.5 |90 DEGREE HOLDER 5.10[No Bid 3.63 2.95 5.35) 2.91 3.50[{No Bid 2.90[No Bid
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55-21NOV12 - Regulatory Signs Term & Supply J&A Traffic Lightle MTS Safety Solutions, |Custom Osburn Vocational
Bid Tabulation SIZE DISCRIPTION Products Rocal Inc. Vulcan Signs Enterprises |Products Inc. Products Corp. |Signotech Associates Enterprises
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, [12"
4.11.1.6 |180 DEGREE HOLDER 14.50|No Bid 11.05 7.88 4.43 8.80 8.95[No Bid 8.20[No Bid
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, (5 1/2"
4.11.1.7 |180 DEGREE HOLDER 5.10[No Bid 3.63 2.95 4.64 2.91 3.50(No Bid 2.90(No Bid
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, [12"
4.11.1.8 |CROSS HOLDER 14.50|No Bid 11.05 7.88 16.39 8.80 8.95[No Bid 8.25(No Bid
FLAT STREET SIGN BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL, (5 1/2"
4.11.1.9 |CROSS HOLDER 5.10[No Bid 3.77 2.95 5.35 2.91 3.50(No Bid 2.90(No Bid
4.11.1. Totals $206.80| $0.00 $211.18 $159.87| $155.55 $193.13 $151.35| $0.00 $221.15| $0.00
4.11.2 POSTS
4.11.21  |U-CHANNEL, 2#/FT (MIN), 3/8 HOLE, 1" CENTER |8 FT 12.00{No Bid 12.39 12.14 29.31 11.88 10.80{No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.11.2.2 |U-CHANNEL, 2#/FT (MIN), 3/8 HOLE, 1" CENTER |10 FT 15.00{No Bid 15.49 15.17 37.07 14.36 13.50{No Bid No Bid 24.75
4.11.2.3 |U-CHANNEL, 2#/FT (MIN), 3/8 HOLE, 1" CENTER |12 FT 18.00{No Bid 18.58 18.20 44.83 16.83 16.20{No Bid No Bid 29.00
4.11.2.4 |ROAD MARKER, WHITE, FLAT, 2-SIDED 3X 6X 62 15.80{No Bid 11.50 13.96{No Bid 14.75 29.68|No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHANNELIZER, FLEXIBLE, BASE MOUNT,
4.11.25 |YELLOW, W/ 6" HI STRIP 36" 27.50{No Bid 24.69 19.90{No Bid 26.55 26.83|No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHANNELIZER, FLEXIBLE, BASE MOUNT,
4.11.2.6 |WHITE, W/ 6" HI STRIP 48" 29.25|No Bid 25.85 21.30/No Bid 28.25 33.33|No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.11.2. Totals $117.55 $0.00 $108.50 $100.67 $111.21 $112.62 $130.34 $0.00 $0.00 $53.75
Section 4.11. Totals $324.35 $0.00 $319.68 $260.54 $266.76 $305.75 $281.69 $0.00 $221.15 $53.75
1st Increase $324.35 $0.00 $335.66 $273.57 $280.10 $321.04 $315.49 $0.00 $243.27 $54.29
2nd Increase $334.08 $0.00 $352.45 $287.25 $294.10 $337.09 $353.35 $0.00 $267.59 $55.37
3rd Increase $350.78 $0.00 $370.07 $301.61 $308.81 $353.94 $395.75 $0.00 $294.35 $58.14
Total 4 year contract cost $1,333.57 $0.00 $1,377.86 $1,122.96 $1,149.77| $1,317.82 $1,346.29 $0.00 $1,026.36 $221.55
4.12. % Increase 1st Renewal 0% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 12% 2% 10% 1%
4.12.1 % Increase 2nd Renewal 3% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 12% 2% 10% 2%
4.12.2 % Increase 3rd Renewal 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 12% 2% 10% 5%
4.15. Coop Purchasing? (Y or N) Y N Y Y Y Y N Y Y Y
Warranted for
5 yrs under
normal use,
does not
include act of
3M warranty God, fire,
Sheeting is 10 Standard Industry applies: flood,
4.16. Warranty Info No info years Warranty No info None Standard  |www.3M.com Standard No info vandalism
N/A; hope to have
Email only: orders System not set up up and going in Order via email: Emailed
4.17. Online Ordering Info No info @roacl.com No info No info for bid capability No Info 2013 info@signotech.cu |No info orders
4.18. Delivery ARO (# days) 14-21 30-45 30(15-45 14-28 30|30; Posts 55 30 30(30-45
Totals: $§  11,475.89 [ $ 58,014.63 [ $ 59,299.18 [ $ 67,172.81 [ $ 101,078.81 [$ 498.88 | $ 81,373.22 [ § 67,647.43 [ $ 57,394.29 | $ 28,743.62
1st Increase| $ 11,475.89 | $ 60,915.36 | $ 62,264.13 | $ 70,531.45 [ $ 106,132.75 | $ 523.82 | $ 91,138.01 | $ 69,000.38 | $ 63,133.72 | $ 29,031.05
2nd Increase| $ 11,820.17 | $ 63,961.13 | $ 65,377.34 | $ 74,058.03 | $ 111,439.39 | $ 550.02 | $ 102,074.57 | $ 70,380.38 | $ 69,447.09 | $ 29,611.67
3rd Increase| $ 12,411.18 | $ 67,159.19 | $ 68,646.21 | $ 77,760.93 | $ 117,011.36 |$ 57752 | $ 114,323.52 | $ 71,787.99 | $ 76,391.80 | $ 31,092.26
Total 4 year contract cost| $ 47,183.14 | $ 250,050.30 | $ 255,586.86 | $289,523.22 | $ 435,662.30 | $ 2,150.24 | $ 388,909.32 | $ 278,816.18 | $ 266,366.89 | $118,478.60

No Bid
R&J Sign Supply Company
AMP Sign Blanks
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