BID TABULATION

Paving Maintenance Supply,

Missouri Petroleum Products

44-21AUG12 - Solid Block Asphalt Vance Brothers Right / Pointe Company Inc. Co.
Estimated
Item | Yearly Qty Description Unit Price | Extended Price| Unit Price | Extended Price] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
4.7.1.| 38,000 |Solid Block Asphalt Sealant $0.680 $25,840.00 $0.499 $18,962.00 $0.50 $19,163.40 $0.48 $18,202.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Long Handle "V" Squeegee w/ 12" red
4.7.2. 6 (high heat silicone) blade $45.00 $270.00 NO BID $0.00 $45.95 $275.70 $49.00 $294.00 $0.00 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
12" Red (high heat silicone) replacement
4.7.3. 12 squeegee blades $10.50 $126.00 NO BID $0.00 $10.75 $129.00 $12.00 $144.00 $0.00 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
Swivel Tip for Crafco Crack seal
474 2 machine Part #CRA27130 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $105.55 $211.10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
475 2 Drip Stopper, Part #CRA27114 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $38.98 $77.96 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
4.7.6 2 Stop Shroud, Part #CRA27115 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $33.33 $66.66 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
4.7.7 GRAND TOTAL $26,236.00 $18,962.00 $19,923.82 $18,640.00 #VALUE! $0.00
4.7.8. Maximum % Increase for Renewals
% 2nd 6-month Renewal 5% 5% 3% 10% 0% 0%
% 3rd 6-month Renewal NA 7% 3% NA 0% 0%
% 4th 6- month Renewal NA 12% 3% NA 0% 0%
4.7.9. Delivery After Receipt of Order 3 7 7-14 14-21 xx Days xx Days
4.7.10. Minimum Order Requirement? 1 PALLET (70 BOXES) 17 PALLETS 38,000 LBS 38,000 LBS 0 0
Boxes must be in sellable shape,
not weathered or ripped. County is
Will accept material back with |Limited Warranty & Return 20% Restocking fee plus freight to |responsible for delivery back to our
4.7.11 Vendor Return Policy 10% restocking fee Policy attached return yard in St. Louis, MO
4.8. CO-OP (Y or N) NO YES YES NO




