61-14DEC11 - Photocopier Maintenance - Commission Office, Circuit Clerk, Recorder

BID TABULATION

Sumner Group Inc. dba Image
Technologies a Division of

Electronic Risks Consultants,

Da-Com Columbia Data Comm Datamx Inc.
4.8. Description Annual Annual Overage — Cost Annual Overage — Cost Annual Overage — Cost Annual Overage — Cost
Copies | Maintenance Per Copy Maintenance Per Copy Maintenance Per Copy Maintenance Per Copy
Cost Cost Cost Cost
4.8.1.|Copier #1 — Kyrocera KM-4030: Commission
KM-4030 - fiscal year 2012 100,000] $1,200.00 $0.012] No Bid No Bid $800.00 $0.008| $1,200.00 $0.01
KM-4030 — fiscal year 2013 100,000] $1,300.00 $0.013 No Bid No Bid $800.00 $0.008| $1,236.00 $0.01
KM-4030 — fiscal year 2014 100,000] $1,400.00 $0.014] No Bid No Bid $800.00 $0.008| $1,297.00 $0.01
KM-4030 — fiscal year 2015 100,000] $1,500.00 $0.015 No Bid No Bid $880.00 $0.008| $1,336.73 $0.01
KM-4030 — fiscal year 2016 100,000] $1,600.00 $0.016] No Bid No Bid $968.00 $0.008| $1,403.57 $0.01
4.8.2. |Copier #2 — Canon Image Runner 5000: Circuit Clerk
IR5000 — fiscal year 2012 200,000 No Bid No Bid $1,200.00 $0.006] $1,000.00 $0.005 $1,975.00 $0.01
IR5000 — fiscal year 2013 200,000, No Bid No Bid $1,260.00 $0.0063 $1,000.00 $0.005 $2,034.25 $0.01
IR5000 — fiscal year 2014 200,000, No Bid No Bid $1,340.00 $0.0067 $1,000.00 $0.005 $2,135.96 $0.01
IR5000 — fiscal year 2015 200,000, No Bid No Bid $1,420.00 $0.0071 $1,100.00 $0.005 $2,200.04 $0.01
IR5000 — fiscal year 2016 200,000, No Bid No Bid $1,500.00 $0.0075 $1,210.00 $0.005 $2,310.04 $0.01
4.8.3. |Copier #3 — Canon Image Runner 3030: Circuit Clerk / Probate Clerk
Canon Image Runner 3030 — fiscal year 2012 75,000] No Bid No Bid $450.00 $0.006] $488.00 $0.005 $825.00 $0.01
Canon Image Runner 3030 — fiscal year 2013 75,000, No Bid No Bid $472.50 $0.0063 $488.00 $0.005 $849.75 $0.01
Canon Image Runner 3030 — fiscal year 2014 75,000] No Bid No Bid $502.50 $0.0067 $488.00 $0.005 $892.24 $0.01
Canon Image Runner 3030 — fiscal year 2015 75,000, No Bid No Bid $532.50 $0.0071 $488.00 $0.005 $919.01 $0.01
Canon Image Runner 3030 — fiscal year 2016 75,000] No Bid No Bid $562.50 $0.0075 $488.00 $0.005 $964.96 $0.01
4.8.3. |Copier #4 — Ricoh Aficio 551: Recorder
Ricoh Aficio 551 — fiscal year 2012 10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00] $0.0075 $1,795.00 $0.01
Ricoh Aficio 551 — fiscal year 2013 10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00] $0.0075 $1,848.85 $0.01
Ricoh Aficio 551 — fiscal year 2014 10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $0.0075 $1,941.29 $0.01
Ricoh Aficio 551 — fiscal year 2015 10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.00 $0.0075 $1,999.53 $0.01
Ricoh Aficio 551 — fiscal year 2016 10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.00 $0.0075 $2,099.51 $0.01

No Bids
K-O-P-1

Note: For Recorder's Ricoh
551, this vendor will be
replacing with a used Kyocera

KM-5035 or similar




