Bid Tabulation: MM57 - Bitminous Material

SemMaterials Vance Brothers Missouri Petroleum Coastal Energy Corporation
Delivered ([Picked up|Picked up|Delivered |Picked up|Picked up|Delivered (Picked up|Picked up |Delivered [Picked up|Picked up)
Unit Price  [Unit Unit Unit Price |Unit Unit Unit Price [Unit Unit Unit Price  [Unit Unit
per/gal full |Price/gal |Price/gal |per/gal full |Price/gal |Price/gal |per/gal full|Price/gal |Price/gal full |per/gal full |Price/gal |Price/gal
transport  |3000 Gal (full transport |3000 Gal (full transport |3000 Gal |transport transport  |3000 Gal (full
load transport |load transport |load load load transport
minimum load minimum load minimum minimum load
Unit Description
Gallon CRS-2 $2.14 $2.05 $2.05 $2.19 $2.10 $2.10 $2.89 $2.65 $2.65 $2.13 $2.10 $2.10
Gallon MC-3000 PDS PDS PDS $2.49 $2.40 $2.40 $3.59 $3.35 $3.35 $2.89 $2.83 $2.83
Gallon PEP PDS PDS PDS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-Full Tanker
Load
SS1 PDS PDS PDS $2.19 $2.10 $2.10 $2.89 $2.65 $2.65 $2.13 $2.10 $2.10
Gallon CRS2P $2.45 $2.36 $2.36 $2.54 $2.45 $2.45 $3.49 $3.25 $3.25 $2.43 $2.35 $2.35
1-Full Tanker
Load
MC-800 PDS PDS PDS $2.49 $2.40 $2.40 $3.59 $3.35 $3.35 $2.92 $2.87 $2.87
Gallon
No No
AEP PDS PDS PDS $3.09 $3.00 $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.43 Response| Response
Gallon Emulsified
Asphalt EA-90 $2.14 $2.05 $2.05 $2.09 $2.00 $2.00 $2.89 $2.65 $2.65 $2.39 $2.35 $2.35
Gallon Asphalt EA-
90P $2.45 $2.36 $2.36 $2.54 $2.45 $2.45 $3.49 $3.25 $3.25 $2.39 $2.35 $2.35
Per Hour Demurrage
Charge $56.00 $70.00 $80.00 $65.00
Demurrage Charge begins
after _____hours 1.5 1.5 2.0 2.0
Coop NO YES NO YES
Delivery Days ARO ONE ONE ONE ONE
Maximum % Renewal
Increase 10% 50% Not Participating in Renewals 5%

No Bids

Mid-Missouri Limestone




