56-29SEPOQ9 - Erosion Control Products

Carter Waters

Hertz Equipment Rental

BID TABULATION Construction Materials | A.S.P. Enterprises, Inc. Corporation
4.7 PRICING Qty Price Price Price
4.7.1.|Silt Fence: 3’x100° Per Roll 1 $36.00 $35.00 $34.58
4.7.2.|Synthetic Landlok 435 Per 1
Erosion Control Trm Square
6.5’ x138.5 Yard $3.25 $3.00 No Bid
4.7.3.|Synthetic Landlok S2 1
Erosion Control Straw
8x 112.5° Per Roll $48.0480 $30.40 No Bid
4.7.4.|Staples for Erosion 1
Control Fabric 11GA Per case
6”x17x6” of 1,000 $45.00 $35.00 No Bid
4.7.5.|Dayton-Superior N-6 1
Waterstop 50 # pail or
equivalent Each $36.00 No Bid $35.00
4.7.6.|Utility Knife or Folding 1
Utility Knife Each $7.9948 No Bid $4.35
4.8.| Time Until County Can Pickup Product After By 4:30 p.m. Monday-
Receipt of Order Friday No Bid In stock, same day
4.8.1|(If not Local) Delivery Days After Receipt of Large quantities may
Order 2 days 2 days take 2 weeks
4.9|Charges for Optional Delivery All should be in stock No Response FedX is additional chg.
4.10|Charges for Optional Installation $10.00 No Response n/a - do not install
% Discount for all Products introduced after
inception of the contract and all existing
4.11|products not specified herein 25% No Response 25%
4.12|Max % Increase 1st Renewal 5% 10% Dependent on suppliers
Max % Increase 2nd Renewal 5% 10% Dependent on suppliers
Max % Increase 3rd Renewal 5% 10% Dependent on suppliers
4.13|/COOP Yes Yes Yes
No Bids

Bazan Painting Company




