
52-24SEP09-Lakewood Estates, 

Lakewood Villas, and Valley 

Creek NID

Engineers Estimate

Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price

Mobilization LS 1 15000 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $7,679.56 $7,679.56 $10,000.00

Traffic Control LS 1 15000 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $6,075.50 $6,075.50 $5,000.00

Erosion Control LS 1 10000 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $19,026.95 $19,026.95 $23,840.00

Street Excavation and Removals LS 1 60000 $47,370.00 $47,370.00 $79,000.00 $79,000.00 $63,339.24 $63,339.24 $83,000.00

Driveway Excavation and Removals SEE 1420 11360 $3.00 $4,260.00 $8.50 $12,070.00 $10.21 $14,498.20 $13.60

Storm Water Removals LS 1 10000 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $3,185.39 $3,185.39 $12,420.00

Tree Removal EA 7 3500 $200.00 $1,400.00 $320.00 $2,240.00 $407.55 $2,852.85 $250.00

Subgrade Extra Depth Removal/Replacement CY 25 5000 $250.00 $6,250.00 $85.00 $2,125.00 $49.84 $1,246.00 $100.00

Gutter Drain - Pop Up Outflow Emitter EA 20 500 $100.00 $2,000.00 $40.00 $800.00 $197.82 $3,956.40 $50.00

French Drain LF 50 500 $25.00 $1,250.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $15.19 $759.50 $33.00

Driveway Replacement SY 1420 71000 $40.00 $56,800.00 $36.30 $51,546.00 $50.48 $71,681.60 $45.00

Concrete Flume LS 1 1500 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,281.08 $3,281.08 $4,377.00

Grass Swale w/ C350 Turf Reinforcement Mat LF 60 1200 $42.00 $2,520.00 $12.00 $720.00 $13.53 $811.80 $20.00

4'x3' Type M Inlet EA 7 17500 $2,117.00 $14,819.00 $3,300.00 $23,100.00 $2,265.01 $15,855.07 $1,529.00

8'x4' Type M Inlet EA 1 3000 $2,684.00 $2,684.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,875.34 $2,875.34 $2,970.00

Junction Box EA 1 2500 $1,832.00 $1,832.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,060.64 $2,060.64 $1,166.00

15" HDPE LF 186 7440 $25.00 $4,650.00 $25.50 $4,743.00 $28.36 $5,274.96 $40.00

18" HDPE LF 414 18630 $25.00 $10,350.00 $34.00 $14,076.00 $33.66 $13,935.24 $43.00

Construction Staking LS 1 8000 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,547.78 $8,547.78 $10,000.00

Restoration LS 1 10000 $15,250.00 $15,250.00 $16,200.00 $16,200.00 $25,929.82 $25,929.82 $39,840.00

Sanitary Sewer Mobilization LS 1 2000 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $552.89 $552.89 $2,350.00

Sanitary Sewer Construction Staking LS 1 600 $300.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $691.13 $691.13 $550.00

Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 1 3000 $3,843.00 $3,843.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,598.81 $3,598.81 $3,850.00

Sanitary Sewer Main (8" SDR 26) LF 287 8610 $40.00 $11,480.00 $44.50 $12,771.50 $41.07 $11,787.09 $41.80

Sanitary Sewer Service Connection EA 1 500 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,040.00 $2,040.00 $505.28 $505.28 $660.00

Total $286,340.00 245,658.00 286,131.50 290,008.12

Pavement Replacement - Option 1

4"Type 1 Rolled Stone Base Rock SY 10086 $70,602.00 $2.80 $28,240.80 $5.20 $52,447.20 $6.45 $65,054.70 No Bid

6" Concrete Street Pavement SY 9474 $454,752.00 $26.50 $251,061.00 $33.60 $318,326.40 $28.57 $270,672.18 No Bid

Total of Option 1 $525,354.00 $279,301.80 $370,773.60 $335,726.88

Pavement Replacement - Option 2

4"Type 1` Rolled Stone Base Rock (Under C&G) SY 1529 $10,703.00 $2.80 $4,281.20 $13.36 $20,427.44 Blank Blank $9.00

18" Concrete Roll-Back Curb and Gutter LF 5505 $55,050.00 $12.00 $66,060.00 $14.60 $80,373.00 Blank Blank $10.00

5.5 Roller Compacted Concrete SY 8506 $323,228.00 $16.33 $138,902.98 $19.38 $164,846.28 Blank Blank $17.00

2" BP-2 Asphalt Pavement SY 8506 $76,554.00 $8.22 $69,919.32 $8.63 $73,406.78 Blank Blank $7.74

Total of Option 2 $465,535.00 $279,163.50 $339,053.50 #VALUE!

Pavement Replacement - Option 3

18" Concrete Roll-Back Curb and Gutter LF 5505 $55,050.00 Blank Blank $14.60 $80,373.00 Blank Blank $10.00

4"Type 1 Rolled Stone Base SY 10086 $70,602.00 Blank Blank $5.18 $52,245.48 Blank Blank $4.28

6.5" Bituminous Base Course SY 8506 $255,180.00 Blank Blank $25.40 $216,052.40 Blank Blank $23.00
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1.5" BP-2 Asphaltic Pavement SY 8506 $55,289.00 Blank Blank $7.80 $66,346.80 Blank Blank $6.50

Total of Option 3 $436,121.00 #VALUE! $415,017.68 #VALUE!

Project Total w/Option 1 $811,694.00 $524,959.80 $656,905.40 $625,735.00

Project Total w/Option 2 $751,875.00 $524,821.50 $625,185.00 Blank

Project Total w/Option 3 $722,461.00 $701,149.18 Blank
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Average

Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

$10,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $27,668.51

$5,000.00 $31,296.00 $31,296.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $10,910.21

$23,840.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $14,900.00 $14,900.00 $11,700.00 $11,700.00 $12,780.99

$83,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $141,000.00 $141,000.00 $102,300.00 $102,300.00 $90,858.46

$19,312.00 $6.00 $8,520.00 $21.30 $30,246.00 $4.20 $5,964.00 $13,552.89

$12,420.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $6,057.91

$1,750.00 $680.00 $4,760.00 $475.00 $3,325.00 $525.00 $3,675.00 $2,857.55

$2,500.00 $68.00 $1,700.00 $100.00 $2,500.00 $262.00 $6,550.00 $3,267.29

$1,000.00 $400.00 $8,000.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $400.00 $8,000.00 $3,822.34

$1,650.00 $29.00 $1,450.00 $54.00 $2,700.00 $52.50 $2,625.00 $1,633.50

$63,900.00 $49.00 $69,580.00 $42.00 $59,640.00 $44.10 $62,622.00 $62,252.80

$4,377.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $3,475.00 $3,475.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,361.87

$1,200.00 $45.00 $2,700.00 $27.00 $1,620.00 $44.10 $2,646.00 $1,745.40

$10,703.00 $2,800.00 $19,600.00 $4,150.00 $29,050.00 $2,250.00 $15,750.00 $18,411.01

$2,970.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00 $3,354.19

$1,166.00 $2,560.00 $2,560.00 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $2,274.09

$7,440.00 $75.00 $13,950.00 $28.60 $5,319.60 $26.25 $4,882.50 $6,608.58

$17,802.00 $80.00 $33,120.00 $31.85 $13,185.90 $26.25 $10,867.50 $16,190.95

$10,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $7,150.00 $7,150.00 $12,075.00 $12,075.00 $9,853.25

$39,840.00 $14,900.00 $14,900.00 $42,300.00 $42,300.00 $32,700.00 $32,700.00 $26,731.40

$2,350.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,110.00 $2,110.00 $1,785.00 $1,785.00 $1,499.70

$550.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $525.00 $525.00 $1,005.88

$3,850.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,435.00 $3,435.00 $3,850.00 $3,850.00 $3,596.69

$11,996.60 $58.00 $16,646.00 $35.85 $10,288.95 $42.00 $12,054.00 $12,432.02

$660.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,320.00 $1,320.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $1,355.04

339,276.60 426,282.00 432,890.45 388,331.00 $344,082.52

No Bid Blank Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48,580.90

No Bid Blank Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $280,019.86

#VALUE! Blank Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $328,600.76

$13,761.00 $7.50 $11,467.50 $22.00 $33,638.00 No Bid No Bid $19,823.49

$55,050.00 $12.75 $70,188.75 $13.00 $71,565.00 No Bid No Bid $69,294.19

$144,602.00 $17.96 $152,767.76 $23.25 $197,764.50 No Bid No Bid $164,995.14

$65,836.44 $8.22 $69,919.32 $8.20 $69,749.20 No Bid No Bid $69,727.94

$279,249.44 $304,343.33 $372,716.70 No Bid $323,840.74

$55,050.00 Blank Blank $13.00 $71,565.00 $14.44 $79,492.20 $71,620.05

$43,168.08 Blank Blank $8.00 $80,688.00 $5.45 $54,968.70 $57,767.57

$195,638.00 Blank Blank $29.00 $246,674.00 $27.35 $232,639.10 $222,750.88
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$55,289.00 Blank Blank $7.50 $63,795.00 $6.79 $57,755.74 $60,796.64

$349,145.08 Blank Blank $462,722.00 $424,855.74 $412,935.13

Blank Blank No Bid No Bid $602,533.40

$618,526.04 $730,625.33 $805,607.15 No Bid $660,953.00

$688,421.68 Blank $895,604.65 $813,186.74 $774,590.56
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