44-03AUGO9 - Law Enforcement Equipment

PRICING Adamson Industries Corp. MES Ed Roehr Safet Products Alamar Uniforms GT Distributors, Inc. OMB Lawman's & Shooters' Supply
[LEATHER |
Product Description

&
S

Qty | Extended Extended | Unit Price | Qty | Extended | UnitPrice | Qty | Extended | Unit Qty | Extended | UnitPrice | Qty | Extended

Price Price Price Price Price Price

Model # 94-XX-9
(XX = S1ZE)
Underbelt Safariland
199

$43.25 12 $519.00 $58.04 12 $696.48 No Bid 12 No Bid $42.76 12 $513.12

Model # 99-XX-9
(XX = SIZE)

Underbelt Safariland
#99

472, $21.50 12 $258.00 $28.85 12 $346.20 No Bid 12 No Bid $21.26 12 $255.12

Not Available Not Available|
47.2.1. 2 $21.50 inSTX Finish | 12 |in STX Finish| NoBid [ 12 No Bid N/A 2 N/A
Safariland Model
6360 Holster w/ALS
level III - Clarino
Finish

Model # 6360-X-XX
(Depending On
Weapon Make, Model)

$120.27 5 $601.35 No Bid S No Bid $92.00 5 $460.00 No Bid 5 No Bid

Safariland Model
6360 Holster w/ALS
level 11T - FTX

4.7.3.1,|Clarino Finish $86.05 5 $430.25 | NoBid 5 No Bid $67.99 5 §339.95 | NoBid | 5 No Bid

Sccurity Holster
Safariland 53

Model # 553 070-X-
XX (Depending on
Weapon Make, Model)

5 $469.25 $130.17 5 5 $515.00

Double Magazine
Holders

Models that MUST be
available: Glock
Models 17, 19, 21, 22,
or 23. Sig Saur P226 -
Beretta 92F or 92C
[Model # B629 10 $225.90 $27.09 10 $270.90
Taser Cartridge
“Dump Pouch”
o[ Model #DTC3

$22.21 10 $222.10 $23.46 10 $234.60

N/A 5 N/A $29.09 5 $145.45

Taser X-26 Holster

Model # 44952 OR
44953

$49.95 5 $249.75 No Bid No Bid N/A 5 N/A No Bid s No Bid

4.7.8[Model # HS83CL No Bid 15 No Bid $24.83 15 $37245 $20.35 $305.25
Glove Pouches
Safariland 33

4.7.9.[Model # 33-9V $146.00
Belt Keepers
Model# 7906

$21.12 15 $316.80

$11.42 10 $114.20

$20.34 10 $203.40

Mace Holder Gould &|
Goodrich Open top
Carrier #H549
4.7.11.[Model # H549 CL $1565 | 10 $156.50
[ASP Collapsible
Baton Holder/ Stinger
Holder

4.7.12[Model # H550-21 CL $192.10
Sidebreak Asp Baton
Scabbard

Model # BA 164 BLK
oL
21 ASP Expandable
Batons F21B

4.7.13.] No Bid 10 No Bid $23.00 10 $230.00 No Bid 10 No Bid

4.7.14.[Model # ASP F21B $628.00 NoBid | 10 No Bid $69.00 10 $690.00 | NoBid | 10 No Bid

MISCELLANEOUS
.[EQUIPMENT
Radio Holders: Porta
Clips

Qty [ Extended

Extended | Unit Price Extended | Unit Price Extended | Unit Qty | Extended | UnitPrice | Qty | Extended | Unit | Qty | Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

&
2




Porta Clip model

#MXATT for
Motorola Portable
Radio models
XTS2500, PR1500;
and Porta Clip Model
# MCATT for
Motorola HT1000.

Pepper Spray — Saber
Defense S1H2030 10%
Oleoresin Capsicum
series or equivalent

-Saber MK-4

Pepper Spray - Saber

Defense SIH2030 10%
Oleoresin Capsicum
series or equivalent

-Saber MK-6

Pepper Spray — Saber
Defense 51H2030 10%
Oleoresin Capsicum
series or equivalent

Saber MK-9

Handcuffs Smith and

‘Wesson Model #100

Model #SW350103

Leg Irons Smith and
Wesson Model #1900

Model# KR-S&W-

350121

Belly Chain Smith
and Wesson Model
#1800

' |Model # 350109

5.1 "Light for Life"
UC3.400 Flashlight w/
charger

90 second charging

4.8.10.]

Rechargeable
Magcharger

ight: Mag-Lite
Magcharger

Product Number
RX1019

4.8.11.]

Magcharger
Replacement Battery
Stick

Product Number
ARXXO075

4.8.12.]

Magcharger
Replacement Halogen
Lamp

Product Number
LRO0001

4.8.13.]

Magcharger
Replacement Lens
Product Number 108-
060

4.8.14.]

Magcharger
Replacement Lamp
Reflector

Product Number 108-
104

4.8.15.]

Magcharger
Replacement
Charging Cradle

Product Number
ARXX025

Cyalume Lightstick

Flares

o

$135.00

_ = = _ . " " -

$139.08

$360.00

3549

$532.35

$20.72

$310.80

$17.91

$198.30

$268.65

$36.89

$553.35

$32.85

$492.75

82.49

$884.85

$57.08

$856.20

$53.42

$801.30

$152.50

$2,287.50

$1,237.35

$85.66

$1,284.90

$140.44

$2,106.60

$325.25

$21.86

$327.90

$552.15

$825.60

$18.91

$18.91

$77.16 15 $1,157.40 | $83.57 15 $1,253.55
$18.52 1 $18.52
$6.05 1 $6.05
$4.26 1 $4.26
$18.63 1 $18.63
$21.59 1 $21.59




Product Number Red -
9-08089, yellow-9-
4.8.16.|08087

Cyalume Lightstick
Flares

Product Number Red
08012, yellow 9-08014,
4.8.17.|Ereen 9-08011

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Latent Finger Print
Kit: Sirchie Search T
Kit or Equivalent:
#177L.
4.8.18,[Product Number 1771

$120.17 6

Riot Helmet by
American Body
Armor

“Helmet cannot weigh
more than 21b-100z.

4.8.19.] $157.99 4

Streamlight Flashlight
with Chargers:
Stinger

Product Number 75024

4.8.20.] $112.50 10 $1,125.00 $95.00 10 $950.00 $109.80 10 $1,098.00 $98.00

$973.60

Stinger Replacement
Charger

Product Number 75103

$27.50 1 $27.50 $23.70 1 $23.70 $27.45 1 $27.45 $25.66 1 $25.66

Stinger Replacement
Battery Stick

Product Number 75175

4.8.22.] $14.35 1 $14.35 $12.10 1 $12.10 $14.03 1 $14.03

Stinger Replacement
Bulh
Product Number 75914

$6.25 1 $6.25 $5.21 1 $5.21 $6.03 1 $6.03 $7.02 1 $7.02

Stinger Fast Charger
120V Cord
Product Number 22665

$18.15 1 $18.15 $15.29 1 $15.29 $17.69 1 $17.69 $17.16 1 $17.16

Stinger Replacement
Lamp Assembly

Product Number 75956

4.8.25.] $9.39 1 $9.39

$9.93 1 $9.93

Rolling Measuring
Wheel Device

Product Number MM30)

4.8.26.]

$77.65 5 $388.25

$114.75 $573.75

$100.57 5 $502.85

MISCELLANEOUS
UNIFORM
4.9.|EQUIPMENT

Unit Price Extended | Unit Price Extended Unit Qty Extended Unit Price Qty Extended Unit Qty Extended

Price Price Price Price Price Price

Collar Brass
Blackington #7/HG

_|-Hi-glo finish. 2 $13.52 20 $270.40 SIL11 20 $222.20 $13.00 20 $260.00

Badges Blackington
#748

| with full color. $59.00 10 $590.00

$52.05 10 $520.50 $46.94 10 $469.40 $52.17 10 $521.70

Wallet Badge
Blackington #748

4.9.3|with full color. $59.00 10 $590.00 $52.05 10 $520.50 $52.17 10 $521.70

Hat Badge

4.9.4.[Blackington A2687W $24.00 10 $240.00 $21.00 10 $210.00 $19.86 10 $198.60 $19.54 10 $195.40

Engraved One Line
4.9.5.|Nameplate

$7.25

$6.41 $8.99| 8.21
1 $7.25 1 $6.41 1 $8.99 1 $8.21

$1,732.25 $1,324.80 $1,527.81 $1,085.79 $1,507.01

NYLON DUTY
4.10|GEAR

Nylon Duty Belt
Model #

4.10.1

$12.85 12 $154.20 $17.28 12 $207.36 $17.80 $213.60 $26.00 12 $312.00 $21.43 12 $257.16

Nylon or plain leather
Underbelt




Model #

4.10.2]

Nylon Double
Magazine Holders
Nylon Single Hand

Model #

4.10.3 |

4.10.4]

S Nylon
Glove Pouch 4600-

[Nylon Belt Keepers
Model #

4.10.6|

Nylon ASP
Collapsible Baton
Holder

Model #

4.10.7|

Sidebreak Asp Baton
Scabbard

Model #

(Nylon Double Hand
Cuff Case

Model #

[Nylon Holster for

Model #

4.10.10|

Replacement Buckle
for Nylon Belt

Model #

4.10.11

$9.50

$114.00

12 $152.88

$12.12

10

$121.20

$16.27

10 $162.70

$86.50

$14.00

$168.00

$16.90

$202.80

$19.00

10

$190.00

$16.23

$162.30

$7.76

$4.50

$155.20

$10.40

10

$45.00

$8.72

$6.71

$10.40

$14.00

20

$280.00

$13.01

$260.20

$11.00

$132.00

$8.34

$100.08

$8.00

$80.00

$9.27

$92.70

$106.92

$13.00

$156.00

$22.00

$11.91

10 $119.10

$23.00

$230.00

$17.00

10

$170.00

$11.64

$139.68

$159.80

$10.40

$19.99

$199.90

$8.00

10

$80.00

$4.02

$1,510.78

$5.00

10

$50.00

$1,848.00

$107.80

VEHICLE
ACCESSORIES - Any
accessories in this
section requiring
mounting brackets and
hardware must be bid to| ~ Unit
|include these items. Price

-

Qty

Extended
Price

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

Unit Price

Qty

Extended
Price

Unit Price

Extended
Qty Price

Unit

Prisoner Seat

Product Number

4.11.1 $489.00

$489.00

No Bid

No Bid

$429.00

$429.00

570.92

1 $570.92

Setina Security
Partition - With full
lower extension panels

4.11.2,

$459.00

$2,295.00

No Bid

$430.00

$2,150.00

490.22

$2,451.10

$492.31

Qty

Extended
Price

$2,461.55

Unit Price

Extended
Price

Unit
Price

Qty

Extended
Price

See Bid

See Bid

$2,784.00

Maximum % Increase
st Renewal Period
2nd Renewal Period
COOP

% Discount For Non-
Catalog Items
Delivery ARO

No Bids
Bob Barker Company

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

$2,579.00

$3,022.02

$2,340.88

10%
14-21 days




