
Estimated 

Rounds Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 

Rounds Unit Price

Extended 

Price

Estimated 

Rounds Unit Price

Extended 

Price

Estimated 

Rounds Unit Price

Extended 

Price

4.7.

4.7.1. 500
NO BID NO BID

500
$5.35 $2,675.00

500
$3.70 $1,850.00

500
NO BID NO BID

4.8.

4.8.1.
30000

$177.60 $5,328.00
30000

$146.00 $4,380.00
30000

$188.88 $5,666.40
30000

$145.80 $4,374.00

4.9.

4.9.1.
3000 $371.85 $1,115.55 3000 N0 BID NO BID 3000 $383.33 $1,149.99 3000 NO BID NO BID

4.9.2.
3000 $288.60 $865.80 3000 NO BID NO BID 3000 $322.22 $966.66 3000 NO BID NO BID

3000 $666.00 $1,998.00 3000
$249.00 PER 

200
$3,735.00 3000 NO BID NO BID 3000 $1,241.50 $3,724.50

4.9.3.

3000 $432.90 $1,298.70 3000
$109.00 PER 

250
$1,308.00 3000 $444.44 $1,333.32 3000 $421.20 $1,263.60

4.9.4.

3000 $455.10 $1,365.30 3000
$87.00 PER 

250
$1,044.00 3000 $388.28 $1,164.84 3000 $338.40 $1,015.20

4.9.5.

3000 $280.83 $842.49 3000
$61.00 PER 

250
$732.00 3000 $266.66 $799.98 3000 NO BID NO BID

4.9.6.

50,000 $321.90 $16,095.00 50,000
$159.00 PER 

500
$15,900.00 50,000 NO BID NO BID 50,000 $275.40 $13,770.00

4.9.7.

9,000 $325.23 $2,927.07 9,000 NO BID NO BID 9,000 $338.88 $3,049.92 9,000 NO BID NO BID

4.9.8.

50,000 $238.65 $11,932.50 50,000 $209.00 $10,450.00 50,000 $205.00 $10,250.00 50,000 $206.50 $10,325.00

4.10.

4.10.1.
10,000 $255.30 $2,553.00 10,000 NO BID NO BID 10,000 NO BID NO BID 10,000 NO BID NO BID

4.10.2.
7,000 $205.35 $1,437.45 7,000 NO BID NO BID 7,000 NO BID NO BID 7,000 NO BID NO BID

4.12.

4.13.

4.14.

4.15.

Addendum #1 Returned

YYES

Will check with Federal at time of 

renewal

Will check with Federal at time of 

renewal

1000

1-1-6 MONTHS

YES

No Bid

40 S&W Caliber New Brass Practice Ammo Jacketed 

Hollow Point, 180 Grain, muzzle velocity, 950 FPS +/- 

FPS, new manufacturer only, no reloads. Brand & Model: 

Federal 40SWA or equivalent.

Reloads (to be used as practice ammunition)

Gil Hebard Guns, Inc.Gulf States Distributors

                          Item

Oklahoma Police Supply OMB's Express Police Supply

Delivery ARO

5%

1 CASE

2020-150 DAYS

No Bid
Maximum % Increase for 2nd Year

Maximum % Increase for 3rd Year

YYES YYES

Minimum Quantity for Order: ______ Rounds Per 

Type

Coop?

5%

6060-150 DAYS

YYES

1000

.45 Caliber 230 Grain. Equivalent to Remington 

Golden Saber BJHP GSB45APB

9mm 124 grain. Equivalent to Remington Golden Saber 

BJHP GSB9MMD

Remington Golden Saber, .45 Caliber 230 grain BJHP 

GSB45APB (NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED)

Remington Golden Saber, 9mm 124 grain, BJHP 

GSB9MMD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED)

12 Gauge Slug: Hollow Point Rifled slug 2-3/4" High 

Brass Only. New manufacturer Only, no reloads. Brand & 

Model: Federal LEB 127-RS or equivalent.

.308 Federal 165 grain tactical rounds TBTL    (Trophy 

Bonded Tactical Load: federal # "LE308T1 ") (NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED)

12 Gauge 00 Buck: 8 Pellets 2-3/4" - High Brass Only. 

New manufacturer only - no reloads. Brand & Model: 

Federal LE133-00 High Brass or equivalent.

Federal American Eagle #AE223 or equivalent: .223 

caliber, 55 grain, full metal case. New manufacturer only. 

No reloads. 

Remington Golden Saber GSB40SWB-29368: 

Remington Golden Saber - No Substitution Allowed. 

Caliber: 40 S & W. New manufacturer only, no reloads.

12 Gauge Birdshot: Game load, # 8 shot 2-3/4". New 

manufacturer only, no reloads. Brand & Model: federal 

Top Gun TGL 12-8 or equivalent.

Bid Tabulation - 57-18NOV08 - Ammunition Term and Supply

Vendor 

Factory Loads

Less-Lethal Ammunition

American Eagle 9mm, 115 grain ball FMJ (NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED)

Other Ammunition

CTS Super Sock 12 gauge (NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

ALLOWED)

NNO  

NNO RENEWAL

NNO RENEWAL

NONE

330 DAYS Usually

Streicher's, Inc.

Ed Roehr Safety Products

NO YES

Kiesler Policy Supply

ProForce Law Enforcement

No Bids

1


