

**Bid Tabulation - 20-06MAY08 - Metal Culvert Pipe**

4.7. PRICING		Contech Construction Products Inc.									
Annular Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe		10 GA. Poly Coated	12 GA. Poly Coated	14 GA. Poly Coated	16 GA. Poly Coated	10 GA. Zinc Coated	12 GA. Zinc Coated	14 GA. Zinc Coated	16 GA. Zinc Coated		
4.8.1.	12", L.F.			\$11.52	\$9.60			\$9.60	\$8.00		
4.8.2.	12" Bands 12" wide, each			\$11.52	\$9.60			\$9.60	\$8.00		
4.8.3.	12" Bands 24" wide, each			\$23.04	\$19.20			\$19.20	\$16.00		
4.8.4.	15", L.F.			\$14.40	\$11.52			\$12.00	\$9.60		
4.8.5.	15" Bands 12" wide, each			\$14.40	\$11.52			\$12.00	\$9.60		
4.8.6.	15" Bands 24" wide, each			\$28.80	\$23.04			\$24.00	\$19.20		
4.8.7.	18", L.F.			\$17.28	\$14.40			\$14.40	\$12.00		
4.8.8.	18" Bands 12" wide, each			\$17.28	\$14.40			\$14.40	\$12.00		
4.8.9.	18" Bands 24" wide, each			\$34.56	\$28.80			\$28.80	\$24.00		
4.8.10.	24", L.F.			\$23.04	\$18.24			\$19.20	\$15.20		
4.8.11.	24" Bands 12" wide, each			\$23.04	\$18.24			\$19.20	\$15.20		
4.8.12.	24" Bands 24" wide, each			\$46.08	\$36.48			\$38.40	\$30.40		
4.8.13.	30", L.F.		\$39.36	\$28.80	\$23.04		\$32.80	\$24.00	\$19.20		
4.8.14.	30" Bands 12" wide, each		\$39.36	\$28.80	\$23.04		\$32.80	\$24.00	\$19.20		
4.8.15.	30" Bands 24" wide, each		\$78.72	\$57.60	\$46.08		\$65.60	\$48.00	\$38.40		
4.8.16.	36", L.F.		\$47.04	\$34.56	\$27.84		\$39.20	\$28.80	\$23.20		
4.8.17.	36" Bands 12" wide, each		\$47.04	\$34.56	\$27.84		\$39.20	\$28.80	\$23.20		
4.8.18.	36" Bands 24" wide, each		\$94.08	\$69.12	\$55.68		\$78.40	\$57.60	\$46.40		

**Bid Tabulation - 20-06MAY08 - Metal Culvert Pipe**

4.7. PRICING		Contech Construction Products Inc.											
		10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.	10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.	10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.
		Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated
4.8.19.	48", L.F. each	\$78.72	\$62.40	\$46.08		\$65.34	\$51.79	\$38.25					
4.8.20.	48" Bands 12" wide, each	\$78.72	\$62.40	\$46.08		\$65.34	\$51.79	\$38.25					
4.8.21.	48" Bands 24" wide, each	\$157.44	\$124.80	\$92.16		\$130.68	\$103.58	\$76.50					
4.8.22.	54", L.F. each	\$68.32	\$70.08	\$51.84		\$73.31	\$73.31	\$43.03					
4.8.23.	54" Bands 12" wide, each	\$68.32	\$70.08	\$51.84		\$73.31	\$73.31	\$43.03					
4.8.24.	54" Bands 24" wide, each	\$176.64	\$140.16	\$103.68		\$146.62	\$146.62	\$86.06					
4.8.25.	60", L.F. each	\$98.88	\$77.76	64.32 (5x1)		\$82.10	\$64.54	\$53.39					
4.8.26.	60" Bands, each	\$197.76	\$155.52	\$128.64		\$82.10	\$129.08	\$106.77					
4.8.27.	60" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid					
4.8.28.	66", L.F. each	\$108.48	\$85.44	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$90.04	\$70.92	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements					
4.8.29.	66" Bands, each	\$216.96	\$170.88	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$180.08	\$141.83	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements					
4.8.30.	66" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	No Bid	No Bid	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		No Bid	No Bid	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements					
4.8.31.	72", L.F. each	\$118.08	105.6 (5x1)	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$98.01	\$87.65	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements					
4.8.32.	72" Bands, each	\$236.16	\$211.20	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$196.02	\$175.30	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements					

**Bid Tabulation - 20-06MAY08 - Metal Culvert Pipe**

4.7. PRICING		Contech Construction Products Inc.					
		No Bid	No Bid	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements	No Bid	No Bid	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.33.	72" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	No Bid	No Bid	\$94.00	\$73.92	\$84.60	\$66.53
4.8.34.	84" L.F. 3 x 1	\$128.00	\$256.00	\$188.00	\$147.84	\$115.20	\$133.06
4.8.35.	84" Bands, each					\$230.40	\$169.20

**Bid Tabulation - 20-06MAY08 - Metal Culvert Pipe**  
**PRICING**

		Contech Construction Products Inc.										
4.7.	PRICING	10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.	10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.
		Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated
4.8.36.	84" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							No Bid
4.8.37.	96", L.F. 3 x 1		\$147.00	\$107.00	\$87.00		\$132.30	\$96.30	\$78.30			\$96.30
4.8.38.	96" Bands, each		\$294.00	\$214.00	\$174.00		\$264.60	\$197.60	\$156.60			\$156.60
4.8.39.	108", L.F. 3 x 1		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid
4.8.40.	108" bands, each		\$158.40	\$115.20	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$142.56	\$103.68	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.41.	35" x 24" R.E. L.F.		\$316.80	\$230.40	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$285.12	\$207.36	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.42.	35" x 24", R.E. Bands, each		\$40.18	\$29.40	\$23.52		\$34.55	\$25.28	\$20.23			\$20.23
4.8.43.	49" x 33", R.E. L.F.		\$40.18	\$29.40	\$23.52		\$34.55	\$25.28	\$20.23			\$20.23
4.8.44.	49" x 33", R.E. Bands, each		\$55.86	\$41.16	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$48.03	\$35.40	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.45.	64" x 43", R.E. L.F.		\$55.86	\$41.16	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$48.03	\$35.40	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.46.	64" x 43", R.E. Bands, each		\$111.72	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$96.10	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.47.	<b>Total Per Company</b>											
4.9.	Lifting Lugs, each	16.00/pair										
4.9.	Coop Yes or No	No										
4.10.	Delivery AFO	14 Days										

**Bid Tabulation - 20-06MAY08 - Metal Culvert Pipe**

4.7.	PRICING	Contech Construction Products Inc.
4.11.	Renewal #1	No Bid
	Renewal #2	No Bid

**Bid Tabulation - 2**  
**PRICING**

		Thompson Culvert Company											
4.7.	Annular Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe	10 GA. Poly Coated	12 GA. Poly Coated	14 GA. Poly Coated	16 GA. Poly Coated	10 GA. Zinc Coated	12 GA. Zinc Coated	14 GA. Zinc Coated	16 GA. Zinc Coated				
4.8.1.	12", L.F. each			\$13.53	\$11.48			\$9.23	\$7.69				
4.8.2.	12" Bands 12" wide, each			\$20.30	\$17.22			\$13.85	\$11.54				
4.8.3.	12" Bands 24" wide, each			\$27.06	\$22.96			\$18.46	\$15.38				
4.8.4.	15", L.F. each			\$16.91	\$13.77			\$11.54	\$9.23				
4.8.5.	15" Bands 12" wide, each			\$25.37	\$20.66			\$17.31	\$13.85				
4.8.6.	15" Bands 24" wide, each			\$33.82	\$27.54			\$23.08	\$18.46				
4.8.7.	18", L.F. each			\$20.30	\$17.21			\$13.84	\$11.54				
4.8.8.	18" Bands 12" wide, each			\$30.45	\$25.82			\$20.76	\$17.31				
4.8.9.	18" Bands 24" wide, each			\$40.60	\$34.42			\$27.68	\$23.08				
4.8.10.	24", L.F. each			\$27.05	\$21.80			\$18.46	\$14.61				
4.8.11.	24" Bands 12" wide, each			\$40.58	\$32.70			\$27.69	\$21.92				
4.8.12.	24" Bands 24" wide, each			\$54.10	\$43.60			\$36.92	\$29.22				
4.8.13.	30", L.F. each			\$33.82	\$27.53			\$23.07	\$18.46				
4.8.14.	30" Bands 12" wide, each			\$66.82	\$41.30			\$34.61	\$27.69				
4.8.15.	30" Bands 24" wide, each			\$91.76	\$55.06			\$46.14	\$36.92				
4.8.16.	36", L.F. each			\$54.84	\$33.28			\$27.69	\$22.30				
4.8.17.	36" Bands 12" wide, each			\$82.26	\$49.92			\$41.54	\$33.45				
4.8.18.	36" Bands 24" wide, each			\$109.68	\$66.56			\$55.38	\$44.60				

**Bid Tabulation - 2**

4.7. PRICING		Thompson Culvert Company									
		10 GA. Poly Coated	12 GA. Poly Coated	14 GA. Poly Coated	16 GA. Poly Coated	10 GA. Zinc Coated	12 GA. Zinc Coated	14 GA. Zinc Coated	16 GA. Zinc Coated		
		\$91.22	\$72.75	\$69.25		\$63.07	\$49.99	\$41.53			
4.8.19.	48" L.F. each	\$136.83	\$109.13	\$103.88		\$94.61	\$74.99	\$62.30			
4.8.20.	48" Bands 12" wide, each	\$182.44	\$145.50	\$138.50		\$126.14	\$99.98	\$83.06			
4.8.21.	48" Bands 24" wide, each	\$108.92	\$86.94	\$78.23		\$77.74	\$61.69	\$54.60			
4.8.22.	54" L.F. each	\$163.38	\$130.41	\$117.35		\$116.61	\$92.54	\$81.90			
4.8.23.	54" Bands 12" wide, each	\$217.84	\$173.88	\$166.46		\$155.48	\$123.38	\$109.20			
4.8.24.	60" L.F. each	\$121.94	\$117.13	\$85.92		\$87.04	\$82.34	\$59.97			
4.8.25.	60" Bands, each	\$243.88	\$234.26	\$171.84		\$174.08	\$164.68	\$119.94			
4.8.26.	60" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	\$487.76	\$468.52	\$343.68		\$348.16	\$329.36	\$239.88			
4.8.27.				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			
4.8.28.	66" L.F. each	\$133.78	\$128.59			\$95.49	\$90.40				
4.8.29.	66" Bands, each	\$267.56	\$257.18	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$190.98	\$180.80				
4.8.30.	66" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	\$535.12	\$514.36	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$381.96	\$361.60				
4.8.31.	72" L.F. each	No Bid	\$140.05	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$110.09	\$98.45				
4.8.32.	72" Bands, each	No Bid	\$280.10	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$220.18	\$196.90				







**Bid Tabulation - 2**

4.7. PRICING	
4.11. Renewal #1	Thompson Culvert Company
Renewal #2	No Bid

**Bid Tabulation - 2**  
**PRICING**

		Metal Culverts Inc.									
4.7.		10 GA. Poly Coated	12 GA. Poly Coated	14 GA. Poly Coated	16 GA. Poly Coated	10 GA. Zinc Coated	12 GA. Zinc Coated	14 GA. Zinc Coated	16 GA. Zinc Coated		
4.8.	Annular Riveted Corrugated Metal Pipe										
4.8.1.	12", L.F. each			\$12.21	\$9.88						
4.8.2.	12" Bands 12" wide, each			\$18.32	\$14.82						
4.8.3.	12" Bands 24" wide, each			\$24.42	\$19.76						
4.8.4.	15", L.F. each			\$15.48	\$12.43						
4.8.5.	15" Bands 12" wide, each			\$23.22	\$18.64						
4.8.6.	15" Bands 24" wide, each			\$30.96	\$24.86						
4.8.7.	18", L.F. each			\$18.31	\$14.76						
4.8.8.	18" Bands 12" wide, each			\$27.47	\$22.14						
4.8.9.	18" Bands 24" wide, each			\$36.62	\$29.52						
4.8.10.	24", L.F. each			\$24.42	\$19.76						
4.8.11.	24" Bands 12" wide, each			\$36.63	\$29.64						
4.8.12.	24" Bands 24" wide, each			\$48.84	\$39.52						
4.8.13.	30", L.F. each		\$41.30	\$29.98	\$24.20		\$30.49	\$21.86	\$17.44		
4.8.14.	30" Bands 12" wide, each		\$61.95	\$44.97	\$36.30		\$45.74	\$32.79	\$26.16		
4.8.15.	30" Bands 24" wide, each		\$82.60	\$59.96	\$48.40		\$60.98	\$43.72	\$34.88		
4.8.16.	36", L.F. each		\$49.22	\$35.75	\$28.86		\$36.34	\$26.08	\$20.80		
4.8.17.	36" Bands 12" wide, each		\$73.83	\$53.63	\$43.29		\$54.51	\$39.12	\$31.20		
4.8.18.	36" Bands 24" wide, each		\$98.44	\$71.50	\$57.72		\$72.68	\$52.16	\$41.60		

**Bid Tabulation - 2**

**4.7. PRICING**

		Metal Culverts Inc.															
		10 GA.		12 GA.		14 GA.		16 GA.		10 GA.		12 GA.		14 GA.		16 GA.	
		Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated
4.8.19.	48", L.F.	\$83.89		\$65.70		\$47.74				\$61.94		\$48.51		\$34.82			
4.8.20.	48" Bands 12" wide, each	\$125.84		\$98.55		\$71.61				\$92.91		\$72.77		\$52.23			
4.8.21.	48" Bands 24" wide, each	\$167.78		\$131.40		\$95.48				\$123.88		\$97.02		\$69.64			
4.8.22.	54", L.F.	\$95.66		\$74.90		\$54.39				\$70.63		\$55.30		\$39.67			
4.8.23.	54" Bands 12" wide, each	\$143.49		\$112.35		\$81.59				\$105.95		\$82.95		\$59.51			
4.8.24.	54" Bands 24" wide, each	\$191.32		\$149.80		\$108.78				\$141.26		\$110.60		\$79.34			
4.8.25.	60", L.F.	\$105.40		\$82.50		\$60.43				\$77.82		\$60.91		\$44.10			
4.8.26.	60" Bands, each	\$158.10		\$133.75		\$90.65				\$116.73		\$91.37		\$66.15			
4.8.27.	60" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	\$632.40		\$495.00		\$362.58				\$466.92		\$365.46		\$264.60			
4.8.28.	66", L.F.	\$115.50		\$90.52			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			\$85.32		\$66.83			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		
4.8.29.	66" Bands, each	\$173.25		\$135.78			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			\$127.98		\$100.25			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		
4.8.30.	66" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	\$693.00		\$543.12			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			\$511.92		\$400.98			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		
4.8.31.	72", L.F.	\$125.83		\$99.40			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			\$92.90		\$73.39			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		
4.8.32.	72" Bands, each	\$188.75		\$149.10			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements			\$139.35		\$110.09			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		

**Bid Tabulation - 2**

4.7. PRICING		Metal Culverts Inc.							
4.8.33.	72" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each	\$754.98	\$596.40	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements		\$557.40	\$440.34	Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements	\$59.50
4.8.34.	84", L.F. 3 x 1		\$135.86	\$98.61		\$81.20	\$100.68	\$72.66	\$59.50
4.8.35.	84" Bands, each		\$271.72	\$197.22		\$162.40	\$201.36	\$145.32	\$119.00

**Bid Tabulation - 2**  
**4.7. PRICING**

		<b>Metal Culverts Inc.</b>							
		10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.	10 GA.	12 GA.	14 GA.	16 GA.
		Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Poly Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated	Zinc Coated
4.8.36.	84" Diameter Bands, 48" wide, each		\$815.16	\$591.66	\$487.20		\$604.08	\$435.96	\$357.00
4.8.37.	96", L.F. 3 x 1		\$155.01	\$112.52	\$92.45		\$114.87	\$82.91	\$67.75
4.8.38.	96" Bands, each		\$310.02	\$225.04	\$184.90		\$229.74	\$165.82	\$135.50
4.8.39.	108", L.F. 3 x 1		\$930.06	\$675.12	\$554.70		\$669.22	\$497.46	\$406.50
4.8.40.	108" bands, each				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.41.	35" x 24" R.E. L.F.		\$173.71	\$137.03			\$128.73	\$100.97	
4.8.42.	35" x 24", R.E. Bands, each				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.43.	49" x 33", R.E. L.F.		\$42.69	\$31.28	\$25.53		\$31.52	\$22.82	\$18.40
4.8.44.	49" x 33", R.E. Bands, each		\$64.04	\$46.92	\$38.30		\$47.28	\$34.23	\$27.60
4.8.45.	64" x 43", R.E. L.F.				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements
4.8.46.	64" x 43", R.E. Bands, each		\$59.39	\$43.49			\$43.85	\$31.72	
	<b>Total Per Company</b>		\$89.09	\$65.24			\$65.78	\$47.58	
4.8.47.	Lifting Lugs, each			Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements				Does not meet H20 Live Load Requirements	
4.9.	Coop Yes or No								
4.10	Delivery ARO								
		\$75.00		<b>Yes</b>		<b>21 Days</b>			

**Bid Tabulation - 2**

4.7.	PRICING	
4.11.	Renewal #1	Metal Culverts Inc. 10%
	Renewal #2	10%