
Bid Tabulation
MM52 - Hot Bituminous Asphalt

APAC of MO Christensen Asphalt

Cost Per Ton Cost Per Ton

A.  “B” Mix $39.50 $41.00

B.  “C” Mix $41.00 $41.00

C.  “D” Mix $41.00 $41.00

Zone 1 $2.91 No Bid
Zone 2 $3.30 No Bid
Zone 3 $4.27 No Bid
Zone 4 $5.24 No Bid
Zone 5 $6.02 No Bid

Zone 1 $2.33 No Bid
Zone 2 $2.72 No Bid
Zone 3 $3.50 No Bid
Zone 4 $4.65 No Bid
Zone 5 $5.82 No Bid

Zone 1 $4.46 No Bid
Zone 2 $4.84 No Bid
Zone 3 $5.43 No Bid
Zone 4 $6.78 No Bid
Zone 5 $7.56 No Bid

Zone 1 $3.87 No Bid
Zone 2 $4.27 No Bid
Zone 3 $5.62 No Bid
Zone 4 $6.59 No Bid
Zone 5 $7.37 No Bid

Cost per ton at Plant Cost per ton at Plant
$50.00 No Bid

n/a No Bid

Yes Yes

72 hr No Response

5%
Subject to MoDot Price Index 

and Fuel Index

72 hr No Response
No Bids
Vance Brothers
Frech Paving Co
Con-Agg of MO

Northwest Quadrant

Northeast Quadrant

FOB Plant Location

Southeast Quadrant

Southwest Quadrant

Delivery Costs, additional to FOB prices above

Delivery after Receipt of Order will 
be made within ________________

Cold Mix Asphalt

Cooperative Purchasing ? 

PRICES TO BE QUOTED FOB DESTINATION

A. Cold-mix w/ anti-stripping 
B. UPM Cold Mix

ARO______Hours or Days

Maximum % Increase for Renewals
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