Bid Tabulation: MM51 - Bitminous Material
Vance Brothers

Coastal Energy Corp

SemMaterials

Delivered |Picked up|Picked up|Delivered |Picked up|Picked up|Delivered |Picked up|Picked up
Unit Price |Unit Unit Unit Price |Unit Unit Unit Price |Unit Unit
per/gal full |Price/gal |Price/gal |per/gal full |Price/gal |Price/gal |pet/gal full|Price/gal |Price/gal
transport  |3000 Gal (full transport |3000 Gal |[full transport (3000 Gal |full
load transport Jload transport |load transport
minimum load minimum load minimum load
Unit Description
Gallon CRS-2 $1.28 $1.17 $1.17 $1.3645 $1.28 $1.25 no bid no bid no bid
Gallon MC-3000 $1.92 $1.81 $1.81 $1.9245 $1.85 $1.82 $1.82 $1.70 $1.82
Gallon PEP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $1.40 $1.30 $1.40
1-Full Tanker
Load
SS1 $1.26 $1.15 $1.15 $1.3449 $1.26 $1.23 $1.20 $1.10 $1.20
Gallon CRS2P $1.56 $1.45 $1.45 $1.5425 $1.46 $1.43 no bid no bid no bid
1-Full Tanker
Load
MC-800 $1.97 $1.86 $1.86 $1.9745 $1.90 $1.88 $1.87 $1.75 $1.87
Gallon AEP $1.51 $1.40 $1.40 $1.3245 $1.27 $1.25 no bid no bid no bid
Gallon Emulsified
Asphalt EA-90 $1.29 $1.18 $1.18 $1.3645 $1.28 $1.25 $1.14 $1.05 $1.14
Gallon Asphalt EA-
90P $1.56 $1.45 $1.45 no bid no bid no bid $1.40 $1.30 $1.40
Per Hour Deurrage
Charge 1.5 hours $70.00 2 hours $50.00 2 hours $50.00
Coop yes yes yes
Delivery Days ARO 24 hours 1 day 1 day maximum
Renewal Increase 50% 20% 10%

No Bids

Frech Paving Co.
Missouri Petroleum




