BID TABULATION

59-06SEP(07 - PRE-PRINTED ENVELOPES

Tension University of Forms Plus
Accent Press | Moore Wallace Envelope Curtis 1000 MO Printing Brown Printing Sir Speedy Brake Printing Cenveo
Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per | Unit Price per
Item Description (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000) (1000)
4.8.1. |#11 241b White Window Envelopes $43.95 $48.50 $51.84 . $35.00 $38.15 $42.46 $42.19 $43.95 $35.15
Non-Responsive -
. . . . did not return
4.8.2. |#10 241b White Window Security Envelopes $69.95 $38.60 No Bid Addendum #1 $85.98 $64.00 $75.00 $64.22 $149.50 $49.75
4.8.3. |#10 241b White Window Envelopes $42.75 $34.50 No Bid with revised $38.10 $38.00 $35.20 $39.06 $57.00 $44.00
4.8.4. |#10 241b Blue Window Envelopes $31.15 $34.85 $45.34 Response Form $33.27 $32.00 $33.14 $33.56 $31.25 $26.55
4.8.5. |#10 24 1b Yellow Insert Envelopes $28.25 $34.98 $49.32 $29.98 $32.00 $29.52 $39.79 $27.95 $25.31
4.8.6. |#10 24 Ib White Insert Envelopes $24.10 $25.52 $26.80 $17.03 $26.00 $23.04 $33.05 $23.75 $20.25
4.8.7. |#10 24 b Regular White Envelopes $46.15 $29.90 No Bid $37.29 $47.40 $40.40 $38.70 $65.00 $38.50
$188.98 (5000
4.8.8. (9" x 12" Window Manilla Envelopes No Bid $598.30 No Bid No Bid $499.50 $536.00 min. order) $498.50 $336.00
4.8.9. |61/2"x9 1/2" 24 Ib Regular White Envelopes $109.50 $178.00 No Bid $125.86 $106.00 $97.00 $99.85 $195.00 $135.00
6 1/2" x 9 1/2" 24 1b Window White $124.73 (5000
4.8.10. |Envelopes $197.50 $473.50 No Bid No Bid $360.00 $325.00 min. order) $395.00 $485.00
Will Not
4.9.1 |Ist Renewal Period 4.65% 4% 6% No Response Guarantee 9% 5% 6% 7%
Will Not
4.9.2. |2nd Renewal Period 4.65% 4% 6% No Response Guarantee 9% 5% 6% 7%
Will Not 5000 Minimum
See Bid Guarantee Order on 4.8.8.
4.10. |Deviations Response See Bid Response | No Response No Response | Renewal Pricing| No Response & 4.8.10. No Response No Response
2-3 Weeks After 15 business days
Approval of 7-10 Working after final proof 10 working
4.12. |Delivery ARO 5 - 24 days 3 weeks 17 days 2-3 Weeks Artwork Days 7-10 days approval days
No Bids

General Printing Service - could not guarantee
pricing for a year

St. Louis Envelope Company - undeliverable




