
Bid tabulation 2006
MM50 - Hot Bituminous Asphalt

APAC-Missouri Christensen Bros. Asphalt

Columbia-Rocky Fork 2505 County Road 269

Cost Per Ton Cost Per Ton

A.  “B” Mix 38.00 41.00

B.  “C” Mix 39.50 41.00

C.  “D” Mix 39.50 41.00

Zone 1 2.77 No Bid
Zone 2 3.14 No Bid
Zone 3 4.07 No Bid
Zone 4 4.99 No Bid
Zone 5 5.73 No Bid

Zone 1 2.22 No Bid
Zone 2 2.59 No Bid
Zone 3 3.33 No Bid
Zone 4 4.43 No Bid
Zone 5 5.54 No Bid

Zone 1 4.25 No Bid
Zone 2 4.61 No Bid
Zone 3 5.17 No Bid
Zone 4 6.46 No Bid
Zone 5 7.20 No Bid

Zone 1 3.69 No Bid
Zone 2 4.07 No Bid
Zone 3 5.35 No Bid
Zone 4 6.28 No Bid
Zone 5 7.02 No Bid

Cost per ton at Plant Cost per ton at Plant
48.00 No Bid

N/A No Bid

Yes Yes

72 Hours
Any time plant is producing 

product

72 Hours
Any time plant is producing 

product
No Bids

Delivery after Receipt of Order will 
be made within ________________

Cold Mix Asphalt

Cooperative Purchasing ? 

PRICES TO BE QUOTED FOB DESTINATION

A. Cold-mix w/ anti-stripping 
B. UPM Cold Mix

ARO______Hours or Days

Northwest Quadrant

Northeast Quadrant

Plant Location

Southeast Quadrant

Southwest Quadrant

S:\PU\06 Bids\Tabs\MM50


