
BID TABULATION 88-12DEC06
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS TERM & SUPPLY

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL
4.8. Delivery ARO
4.10. CO-OP?

4.11.
_______% 2nd Year  _______% 3rd 
Year

4.13.1.
Long Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus-
Men's 60 41.85$           2,511.00$                43.25$          2,595.00$                
Long Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus-
Women's 20 41.85$           837.00$                   43.25$          865.00$                   
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.2.
Short Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus-
Men's 60 37.75$           2,265.00$                40.50$          2,430.00$                
Short Sleeve Shirts-Elbeco Duty Plus-
Women's 20 37.75$           755.00$                   40.50$          810.00$                   
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.3. Clip On Ties-Regular Size 80 4.50$             360.00$                   4.00$            320.00$                   
Clip On Ties-Extra Long 20 5.50$             110.00$                   5.00$            100.00$                   

4.13.4.
Regulation Elbeco ELB 8601 
Turtleneck Shirt 90 42.00$           3,780.00$                19.95$          1,795.50$                
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.5.
Trousers Made to Measure-JB Battle-
Men's 109 87.00$           9,483.00$                
Trousers Made to Measure-JB Battle-
Women's
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.6.

Weather-Tech and Waterproof Duty 
Jacket I. Spiewax Style #1775 or 
Better 20 250.00$        5,000.00$                No Bid

No Bid

48.25$                                             

45.50$                                             

22.00$                                             

No Bid

No Bid

Leon Uniform Company

30 Days
No

3% 2nd Year  6% 3rd Year

47.85$                                              

42.75$                                              

46.00$                                              

87.00$                                              

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc.

30-45 Days
No

10% 2nd Year  8% 3rd Year3% 2nd Year  3% 3rd Year

Larry's Boots

Yes

87.00$                                              



STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.7.
Correction Officer Short Field Jacket 
to be Summit Duty Jacket 20 198.00$         3,960.00$                220.00$        4,400.00$                
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.8. Stratton Winter Felt Uniform Hat 20 98.00$           1,960.00$                

4.13.9. Stratton Summer Straw Uniform Hat 20 65.75$           1,315.00$                

4.13.10.
Reversible Raincoat – Pro-Tuff 
RW167 20
STANDARD OVERSIZE CHARGE. 
COST PER INCREMENTAL SIZE 
OVER XXL

4.13.11. Trouser: Elbeco E615, Sizes - 28-44 10 52.70$           527.00$                   60.00$          600.00$                   

4.13.12. Trouser: Elbeco E615, Sizes - 44-50 10 57.00$           570.00$                   66.00$          660.00$                   

4.13.13. Trouser: Elbeco E615, Sizes - 52-54 10 62.00$           620.00$                   72.00$          720.00$                   

4.13.14.

Boots:  Danner Acadia 8” 
Men’s/Women’s 200 grain Thinsulate, 
waterproof GORE-TEX

4.13.15.

Boots:  Danner Acadia 8” 
Men’s/Women’s, waterproof GORE-
TEX

4.13.16.

Boots:  Magnum Midnite 
Men’s/Women’s (HIT-8200 and HIT-
8201)

4.13.17.
Boots:  Magnum Midnite Side Zip (HIT 
8202)

4.13.18. Shoes:  Magnum Duty Lite (HIT-8208)

4.13.19.
Boots:  Rocky Eliminator 22 
Men’s/Women’s, waterproof GORE-

4.13.20.
Boots:  Rocky FirstMed Men’s 8” Lace 
Up (RKY-911181)

4.13.21.
Boots:  Rocky FirstMed Women’s 8” 
(RKY-911280)

No Bid

No Bid

 $                                          150.00 

No Bid

No Bid

210.00$                                           

200.00$                                           

No Bid

No Bid

275.00$                                           

240.00$                                           

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 8032-$134.00
4044-$123.00 

102.80$                                            

131.00$                                            

No Bid

217.80$                                            

No Bid

Discontinued

210.00$                                            

198.00$                                            

65.00$                                              

69.00$                                              

No Bid

75.00$                                               

55.00$                                               

165.00$                                             

Discontinued

250.00$                                             

245.00$                                             

70.00$                                               


