
BID TABULATION
78-26OCT06 IMAGE SCANNERS: PRODUCTION & LARGE FORMAT

4.8 PRICING OM Office Supply, Inc. Huber & Associates CDW Government Zones, Inc.
Springfield Blue Print

Alternate Bid

Item # Description Firm, Fixed Price Firm, Fixed Price Firm, Fixed Price Firm, Fixed Price Firm, Fixed Price
4.8.1 Item #1 and Options

4.8.1.1
Colortrac CX40E Large Format 
Scanner No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,946.15 $12,547.00

4.8.1.2 Colortrac CX40E Stand No Bid No Bid No Bid $507.24 Included

4.8.1.3 Colortrac CX40E Catch Basket No Bid No Bid No Bid $220.65 Included

4.8.1.4
CopySmart Software for Scan-
to-Print No Bid No Bid No Bid $533.25 Included
TOTAL $11,207.29 $12,547.00

4.8.2 Item #2 and Options

4.8.2.1
Fujitsu fi5750C Scanner (USB 
and SCSI) $5,040.00 $6,097.24 $5,099.00 $5,218.34 No Bid

4.8.2.2
Fujitsu fi5750C 1 Year On-Site 
Maintenance $840.00 $1,095.00 $925.00 $962.12 No Bid

4.8.2.3
Kofax Adrenaline SCSI Card 
Model 650i $672.00 $1,095.00 $389.00 $792.81 No Bid

4.8.2.4
Kofax SCSI Cable PN SC-1026-
0000 $72.00 $80.00 $79.00 $83.49 No Bid
TOTAL $6,624.00 $8,367.24 $6,492.00 $7,056.76

4.9 Warranty Features 3 mo. Onsite service 1 Yr. Next Business Svc See Bid
Colortrac-2 Yr. Parts
Fujitsu-3 mo. Onsite 2 Year Onsite

4.11 CO-OP? No Yes Yes Yes Yes
4.12 Delivery ARO 10 Days 30 Days 10 Days Max 14-21 Days 1 Week

No Bids
Oce North America
Central Communications Service Co.
Midwest Computech



BID TABULATION
78-26OCT06 IMAGE SCANNERS: PRODUCTION & LARGE FORMAT

4.8 PRICING Titian Consulting
Item # Description Firm, Fixed Price
4.8.1 Item #1 and Options

4.8.1.1
Colortrac CX40E Large Format 
Scanner $9,395.00

4.8.1.2 Colortrac CX40E Stand $450.00

4.8.1.3 Colortrac CX40E Catch Basket $199.00

4.8.1.4
CopySmart Software for Scan-
to-Print $600.00
TOTAL $10,644.00

4.8.2 Item #2 and Options

4.8.2.1
Fujitsu fi5750C Scanner (USB 
and SCSI) $5,876.00

4.8.2.2
Fujitsu fi5750C 1 Year On-Site 
Maintenance $1,419.10

4.8.2.3
Kofax Adrenaline SCSI Card 
Model 650i $899.00

4.8.2.4
Kofax SCSI Cable PN SC-1026-
0000 $94.99
TOTAL $8,289.09

4.9 Warranty Features

Fujitsu-Parts & Labor
Colortrac 2 yr is addl 

$900
4.11 CO-OP? Yes
4.12 Delivery ARO 3 Weeks


