BID TABULATION

63-07SEP06 - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL SERVICES

Tiger Striping

JC Landscaping

Diamond C

Greg Alderson

Grant Excavating

Option 1 Medium Duty - Plow & V - Box Spreader 4 WD Pickup or Flatbed

# of Trucks Bid Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
#1 $ 250.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 285.00
#2 $ 250.00 No Bid 3 260.00 | $ 285.00 No Bid
#3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option 2 Medium Duty/Heavy Duty- Plow & V - Box Spreader - Single Axle Dump or Flatbed Truck

# of Trucks Bid Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
#1 No Bid No Bid $ 275.00 No Bid No Bid
#2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option 3 Light Duty - Plow & Tailgate Spreader 4 WD Pickup or Flatbed Truck

# of Trucks Bid Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
#1 $ 250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATION
63-07SEP06 - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL SERVICES

Tiger Striping JC Landscaping Diamond C Greg Alderson | Grant Excavating
Option 4 Light Duty - Plow Only - ¥2 Ton 4 WD Pickup or Flatbed
# of Trucks Bid Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
#1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7.1.1. |Dollar amount of increase for 2nd Contract term

Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
Option 1 $ 260.00 | $ 290.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 25.00
Option 2 No Bid No Bid 3 20.00 No Bid No Bid
Option 3 $ 260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7.1.2. |Dollar amount of increase for 3rd Contract term
Per Hour mour Per Hour Per Hour Per Hour
Option 1 $ 270.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 25.00
Option 2 No Bid No Bid 3 20.00 No Bid No Bid
Option 3 $ 270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9. References Included Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Note: See bid for
Option 3 information

No Bids

Salter Lawn Service
Blacktop Paving Co
Columbia Turf
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