BID TABULATION
08-13APR06 HIGH VISIBILITY APPAREL TERM AND SUPPLY

Cintas Corporation

Loveline Industries, Inc.

PRICING Description Sizes Price/Each Price/Each

S-XL $26.82 No Bid

XXL $29.82 No Bid

471 High Visibility Short 3XL $30.45 No Bid

T Sleeved T-Shirts 4XL $31.20 No Bid

5XL No Response No Bid

6XL No Response No Bid

S-XL $26.82 No Bid

XXL $29.82 No Bid

472 High Visibility Long Sleeved| 3XL $30.45 No Bid

T T-Shrits 4XL $31.20 No Bid

5XL No Response No Bid

6XL No Response No Bid

LG $19.43 $13.60

XL No Response $13.60

473 High Visibility Class IlI XXL $21.04 $13.60

o Vests 3XL $22.82 $13.60

4XL $24.79 $13.60

5XL $26.94 $13.60

LG $13.19 $11.35

XL $13.19 $11.35

4.7 4. High Visibility Class Il Vests ;())EII: 2];;3 il 1 gg

4XL $16.48 $11.35

5XL $17.81 $11.35

S-XL No Response No Bid

XXL No Response No Bid

. I 3XL No Response No Bid

4.7.5. High Visibility Coat XL No Response No Bid

5XL No Response No Bid

6XL No Response No Bid

S-XL No Response No Bid

XXL No Response No Bid

476 High Visibility "Polo" Style 3XL No Response No Bid

T Shirt 4XL No Response No Bid

5XL No Response No Bid

6XL No Response No Bid

S-XL No Response No Bid

XXL No Response No Bid

477 High Visibility Long Sleeved|  3XL No Response No Bid

o Sweatshirt 4XL No Response No Bid

5XL No Response No Bid

6XL No Response No Bid

4.7.8. Option 1 Logo Screen Printing $1.15 $0.45
4.7.9. Option 2 Logo Screen Printing $1.15 $0.45
4.7.10. Option 1 Logo Embroidery $3.50 N/A
4.7.11. Option 2 Logo Embroidery $3.50 N/A

4.7.12. GRAND TOTAL $451.02 $150.60




BID TABULATION

08-13APR06 HIGH VISIBILITY APPAREL TERM AND SUPPLY

Cintas Corporation

Loveline Industries, Inc.

PRICING Description Sizes Price/Each Price/Each

1st Year-N/A 1st Year-3%
4.8. Renewal % Increases 2nd Year-N/A 2nd Year-3%
4.10. Coop? Yes Yes
4.11. Delivery ARO Varies by Freight 21 Days
No Bids

Benton Silk Screening, LLC
Municiple Emergency Services

Aramark

Reflective Apparel Factory




