
 

4.7. Pricing

Item #
Product 
Description

Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Mattresses Per 
Section 2.5.1.

Item #_____
Wool Blankets 
Per Section 
2.5.2.
Item #_____
Poly Cotton 
Blankets Per 
Section 2.5.3.
Item #_____
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.1.

Item #______
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.2.

Item #______
Toothpaste Per 
Section 2.5.5. $26.75 $35.85 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

100 Each

300 Each

100 Each

200 Each

20 Each

35 Cases

Acme Supply Co., LTD

$49.00 $4,900.00

No Bid

No Bid

$2.31 $462.00

$2.31 $46.20

$1,254.75144 Per Case

American Institutional Supply

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

144 Per Case

No Bid

No Bid

Robinson Textiles

$28.77 $2,877.00

$12.90 $3,870.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

4.7.4. $1.63 $326.00

4.7.5. $1.60 $32.00

4.7.6. $936.25

Bid Tab 68-09NOV05 

$2,835.00

4.7.2. $10.25 $3,075.00

4.7.1. $28.35

4.7.3.

Inmate Detention Supplies Term and Supply

Bob Barker Co.

$76.20 $7,620.00



 

4.7. Pricing

Acme Supply Co., LTDAmerican Institutional Supply Robinson Textiles

Bid Tab 68-09NOV05 
Inmate Detention Supplies Term and Supply

Bob Barker Co.

Toothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.1. $5.20 $8.57 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Toothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.2. $4.85 $10.59 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.1.

$42.00 $47.60 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.2.

$28.60 $39.74 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Razors Per 
Section 2.5.8. $27.80 $36.24 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shampoo Per 
Section 2.5.9. $16.95 $31.39 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

35 Cases

5 Cases

4 Cases

75 Cases

50 Cases

100 Cases $3,139.00144 Per Case

500 Per Case

$2,980.50

$1,812.00

1000 Per Case

500 Per Case120 Per Case

$299.95144 Per Case

$52.95

144 Per Case

144 Per Case

500 Per Case

1000 Per Case

96 Per Case4.7.12. $1,695.00

$1,390.00

$190.40

144 Per Case

4.7.9. $168.00

4.7.10. $2,145.00

4.7.11.

4.7.7. $182.00

4.7.8. $24.25



 

4.7. Pricing

Acme Supply Co., LTDAmerican Institutional Supply Robinson Textiles

Bid Tab 68-09NOV05 
Inmate Detention Supplies Term and Supply

Bob Barker Co.

Combs Per 
Section 2.5.10. $2.80 $4.92 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
ID Bands Per 
Section 2.5.11. $119.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Fastening Tool 1 Each $58.95 $58.95 No Bid
Cleaning 
Detergent Per 
Section 2.5.12. $32.00 $44.88 No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
White Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13. 13.20/Dozen $371.50 $250.00 No Bid
Qty Per 
Bale______
Item #______
Brown Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13.
Item #______
Wash Cloths 
Per Section 
2.5.13.
Item #______

No Bid

No Bid

$2,692.80

$3,715.00

180 Per Case

25 Dozen/Bale

25 Cases

75 Per Box

144 Per Case

Not Listed

144 Per Case $123.00

60 Cases 180 Per Case

25 Dozen/Bale

$1,920.00

$2.2520 Dozen

10 Bales

5 Dozen

25 Dozen/Bale

$17.00

$2,500.00

$85.00

$45.00

$13.20 $66.00

4.7.18. $2.25 $45.00

4.7.14. $8,988.75

4.7.16. $3,300.00

4.7.15.

4.7.17.

4.7.13. $70.00

No Bid

No Bid



 

4.7. Pricing

Acme Supply Co., LTDAmerican Institutional Supply Robinson Textiles

Bid Tab 68-09NOV05 
Inmate Detention Supplies Term and Supply

Bob Barker Co.

Latex Gloves 
Per Section 
2.5.14. $6.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Box______
Item #______
Sanitary 
Napkins Per 
Section 2.5.15.
Item #______
Tampons Per 
Section 2.5.16.
Item #______
Women’s 
Underwear Per 
Section 2.5.17. $8.15 See Bid No Bid No Bid
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shirts Per 
Section 2.5.18.
Item #______
Pants Per 
Section 
2.5.19.Per 
Section 2.5.19.
Item #______
Shoes Per 
Section 
2.5.20.Per 
Section 2.5.20.
Item #______

$4.95 $99.00

$2.47 $74.10

$3.95 $79.00

$4.55 $136.50

$7.25 $145.00

$8.10 $162.00

$65.28 $1,632.00

$41.63 $1,040.75

100 Boxes

Not Listed

20 Each

20 Each

30 Each

25 Dozen

50 Per Box

$203.75

4.7.25. $2.85 $85.50

No Bid

4.7.22.

25 Cases

25 Cases

4.7.24. $4.90 $98.00

4.7.23. $4.30 $86.00

No Bid

$7.00 $140.00

4.7.20. $23.30 $582.50

$7.00

4.7.21. $42.55 $1,063.75

No Bid

4.7.19. $675.00

$140.00

No Bid

No Bid



 

4.7. Pricing

Acme Supply Co., LTDAmerican Institutional Supply Robinson Textiles

Bid Tab 68-09NOV05 
Inmate Detention Supplies Term and Supply

Bob Barker Co.

Trash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
12 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______
Trash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
33 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______

4.7.28.
GRAND 
TOTAL $37,671.70 $19,884.80 $7,810.00 $6,999.10

4.8.

Maximum 
Percentage 
Increase for 
each potential 
renewal period:

1st Renewal 
Period 0 2% 0 3%

2nd Renewal 
Period 0 2% 0 3%

4.10. Coop Yes Yes Yes No
4.11. Delivery ARO 7-28 Days 7 Days 30 Days 30 Days

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

60 Boxes4.7.27. No Bid

4.7.26. 60 Boxes No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



 

4.7. Pricing

Item #
Product 
Description

Qty

Mattresses Per 
Section 2.5.1.

Item #_____
Wool Blankets 
Per Section 
2.5.2.
Item #_____
Poly Cotton 
Blankets Per 
Section 2.5.3.
Item #_____
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.1.

Item #______
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.2.

Item #______
Toothpaste Per 
Section 2.5.5.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

100 Each

300 Each

100 Each

200 Each

20 Each

35 Cases

4.7.4.

4.7.5.

4.7.6.

4.7.2.

4.7.1.

4.7.3.

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

$28.80 $30.50 No Bid $28.00

$324.00

$1.68 $33.60

$980.00144 Per Case

ICS

$42.10 $4,210.00

$7.60 $2,280.00

$7.00 $700.00

$1.62

No Bid

Missouri Vocational Enterprises

$135.00 $13,500.00

No Bid

$15.55 $1,555.00

No Bid$380.00

No Bid

$1,067.50144 Per Case

Walter F. Stephens, Jr., Inc.

$31.90 $3,190.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1.90

No Bid

$1,008.00144 Per Case

No Bid

No Bid

Amercare Products, Inc.

No Bid

No Bid



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyToothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.1.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Toothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.2.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.1.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.2.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Razors Per 
Section 2.5.8.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shampoo Per 
Section 2.5.9.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

35 Cases

5 Cases

4 Cases

75 Cases

50 Cases

100 Cases4.7.12.

4.7.9.

4.7.10.

4.7.11.

4.7.7.

4.7.8.

ICSMissouri Vocational EnterprisesWalter F. Stephens, Jr., Inc.Amercare Products, Inc.

$4.76 $5.89 No Bid $5.22

$4.76 $5.69 No Bid $5.18

$39.80 $57.96 $15.60 $41.20

$31.20 $32.80 $53.00 $29.00

$24.50 $27.68 No Bid $4.94

$19.98 $27.78 No Bid $26.00

$247.00100 Per Case

$2,600.00144 Per Case

$164.80500 Per Case

$2,175.001000 Per Case

$182.70144 Per Case

$25.90144 Per Case

$62.40200 Per Case

$3,975.00200 Per Case

$1,384.00Not Listed

$2,778.00144 Per Case

$231.84500 Per Case

$2,460.001000 Per Case

$206.15144 Per Case

$28.45144 Per Case

$1,225.00500 Per Case

$1,998.0096 Per Case

$159.20500 Per Case

$2,340.001000 Per Case

$166.60144 Per Case

$23.80144 Per Case



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyCombs Per 
Section 2.5.10.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
ID Bands Per 
Section 2.5.11.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Fastening Tool 1 Each
Cleaning 
Detergent Per 
Section 2.5.12.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
White Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13.
Qty Per 
Bale______
Item #______
Brown Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13.
Item #______
Wash Cloths 
Per Section 
2.5.13.
Item #______

25 Cases

75 Per Box

60 Cases

20 Dozen

10 Bales

5 Dozen

4.7.18.

4.7.14.

4.7.16.

4.7.15.

4.7.17.

4.7.13.

ICSMissouri Vocational EnterprisesWalter F. Stephens, Jr., Inc.Amercare Products, Inc.

$32.00 $2.90 No Bid $30.00

No Bid $199.90 No Bid $146.00

$79.90 $79.90 $86.00 $86.00

$44.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $279.90 $2.35 $282.50

$17.70 $88.50

$3.50 $70.00

$2,825.0025 Dozen/Bale

$750.002160 Per Case

$146.00500 Per Case

No Bid

.61 each $146.40

$23.5012 Per Bale

No Bid

No Bid

$2,799.0025 Dozen/Bale

$72.50144 Per Case

$199.90500 Per Box

No Bid

$2.40 $48.00

$2,697.00250 Per Case

$800.002160 Per Case



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyLatex Gloves 
Per Section 
2.5.14.
Qty Per 
Box______
Item #______
Sanitary 
Napkins Per 
Section 2.5.15.
Item #______
Tampons Per 
Section 2.5.16.
Item #______
Women’s 
Underwear Per 
Section 2.5.17.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shirts Per 
Section 2.5.18.
Item #______
Pants Per 
Section 
2.5.19.Per 
Section 2.5.19.
Item #______
Shoes Per 
Section 
2.5.20.Per 
Section 2.5.20.
Item #______

100 Boxes

20 Each

20 Each

30 Each

25 Dozen

4.7.25.

4.7.22.

25 Cases

25 Cases

4.7.24.

4.7.23.

4.7.20.

4.7.21.

4.7.19.

ICSMissouri Vocational EnterprisesWalter F. Stephens, Jr., Inc.Amercare Products, Inc.

No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.24

No Bid $10.50 See Bid $10.90

$4.29 $128.70

$5.40 $108.00

$5.80 $116.00

$68.00 $1,700.00

$272.5010 Dozen/Case

$324.00100/Box

$26.00 $650.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.60 $108.00

$5.90 $118.00

$6.75 $135.00

$71.31 $1,782.75

$262.501 Dozen

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$41.95 $1,048.75

$17.95 $448.75



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyTrash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
12 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______
Trash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
33 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______

4.7.28.
GRAND 
TOTAL

4.8.

Maximum 
Percentage 
Increase for 
each potential 
renewal period:

1st Renewal 
Period

2nd Renewal 
Period

4.10. Coop

4.11. Delivery ARO

60 Boxes4.7.27.

4.7.26. 60 Boxes

ICSMissouri Vocational EnterprisesWalter F. Stephens, Jr., Inc.Amercare Products, Inc.

$11,963.10 $17,283.49 $19,262.30 $21,187.70

0 5% 0 8%

0 5% 0 12%

Yes Yes Yes Yes

5 Days 14 Days Not Listed 30 Days

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



 

4.7. Pricing

Item #
Product 
Description

Qty

Mattresses Per 
Section 2.5.1.

Item #_____
Wool Blankets 
Per Section 
2.5.2.
Item #_____
Poly Cotton 
Blankets Per 
Section 2.5.3.
Item #_____
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.1.

Item #______
Slip-on PVC 
Sandals Per 
Section 2.5.4.2.

Item #______
Toothpaste Per 
Section 2.5.5.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

100 Each

300 Each

100 Each

200 Each

20 Each

35 Cases

4.7.4.

4.7.5.

4.7.6.

4.7.2.

4.7.1.

4.7.3.

Unit Price Extended Price

$32.78

$336.00

$1.68 $33.60

$1,147.30144 Per Case

ATD-American Co.

$39.18 $3,918.00

$7.88 $2,364.00

$3.48 $348.00

$1.68



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyToothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.1.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Toothbrushes 
Per Section 
2.5.6.2.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.1.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Soap Per 
Section 2.5.7.2.

Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Razors Per 
Section 2.5.8.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shampoo Per 
Section 2.5.9.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______

35 Cases

5 Cases

4 Cases

75 Cases

50 Cases

100 Cases4.7.12.

4.7.9.

4.7.10.

4.7.11.

4.7.7.

4.7.8.

ATD-American Co.

$57.28

$56.72

$52.98

$33.48

$26.68

$26.78

$1,334.00500 Per Case

$2,678.0096 Per Case

$211.92500 Per Case

$2,511.0072 Per Case

$2,004.801440 Per Case

$283.601440 Per Case



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyCombs Per 
Section 2.5.10.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
ID Bands Per 
Section 2.5.11.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Fastening Tool 1 Each
Cleaning 
Detergent Per 
Section 2.5.12.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
White Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13.
Qty Per 
Bale______
Item #______
Brown Bath 
Towels Per 
Section 2.5.13.
Item #______
Wash Cloths 
Per Section 
2.5.13.
Item #______

25 Cases

75 Per Box

60 Cases

20 Dozen

10 Bales

5 Dozen

4.7.18.

4.7.14.

4.7.16.

4.7.15.

4.7.17.

4.7.13.

ATD-American Co.

$41.88

$124.94

$78.94 $78.94

$49.94

$256.00

$18.98 $94.90

$2.98 $59.60

$2,996.40180 Per Case

$2,560.0025 Dozen/Bale

$1,047.002160 Per Case

$124.94500 Per Case



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyLatex Gloves 
Per Section 
2.5.14.
Qty Per 
Box______
Item #______
Sanitary 
Napkins Per 
Section 2.5.15.
Item #______
Tampons Per 
Section 2.5.16.
Item #______
Women’s 
Underwear Per 
Section 2.5.17.
Qty Per 
Case______
Item #______
Shirts Per 
Section 2.5.18.
Item #______
Pants Per 
Section 
2.5.19.Per 
Section 2.5.19.
Item #______
Shoes Per 
Section 
2.5.20.Per 
Section 2.5.20.
Item #______

100 Boxes

20 Each

20 Each

30 Each

25 Dozen

4.7.25.

4.7.22.

25 Cases

25 Cases

4.7.24.

4.7.23.

4.7.20.

4.7.21.

4.7.19.

ATD-American Co.

$7.64

$8.88

$2.98 $89.40

$4.82 $96.40

$5.88 $117.60

$48.32 $1,208.00

$222.0010 Dozen/Case

$764.0050 Per Box

$27.32 $683.00



 

4.7. Pricing

Product QtyTrash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
12 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______
Trash Bags Per 
Section 2.5.21. - 
33 Gallon

Qty Per 
Box_____
Item #______

4.7.28.
GRAND 
TOTAL

4.8.

Maximum 
Percentage 
Increase for 
each potential 
renewal period:

1st Renewal 
Period

2nd Renewal 
Period

4.10. Coop

4.11. Delivery ARO

60 Boxes4.7.27.

4.7.26. 60 Boxes

ATD-American Co.

$33.94

$21.94

$30,665.20

5%

5%

Yes

15-30 Days

$1,316.40

200 Per Box

100 Per Box

$2,036.40


